
 
PÀ£ÁðlPÀ «zsÁ£À¸À̈ sÉ 

ºÀ¢£ÉÊzÀ£ÉÃ «zsÁ£À¸À¨sÉ 

ºÀ£ÉßgÀqÀ£ÉÃ C¢üªÉÃ±À£À 

ಕකბಟಕ เඋನ෱ಡಲದವರ ๸ಬಳಗำ, ඛไൟ౨  ๆತನಗำ ಮൡ౨  ಭ൤౲ ಗಳ 

(ൟൿ౪ ಪല) เඒಯಕ, 2022 
(2022gÀ «zsÁ£À¸À¨sÉAiÀÄ «zsÉÃAiÀÄPÀ ¸ÀASÉå-06) 

 

 ಕකბಟಕ เඋನ෱ಡಲದವರ ๸ಬಳಗำ, ඛไൟ౨  ๆತನಗำ ಮൡ౨  ಭ൤౲ ಗಳ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 
1956 ಃౙ  ಮತ౨ ๠ౣ  ൟൿ౪ ಪല ෥ಡฤ ಒಂൿ เඒಯಕ. 

 ಇย౵  ಇඝ౬  ෨ಂං ಉഴ ಬฆವ ಉං౪ ೕಶಗัಛಜ ಕකბಟಕ เඋನ෱ಡಲದವರ 
๸ಬಳಗำ, ඛไൟ౨  ๆತನಗำ ಮൡ౨  ಭ൤౲ ಗಳ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1956ඝ౬  (1957ರ ಕකბಟಕ  

ಅඌඛಯಮ 2) ಮತ౨ ๠ౣ  ൟൿ౪ ಪല ෥ഴโൿ ෷ಕ౨ ฿ಜฆโದคಂದ; 

 ಇൿ, ූರತ ಗಣฃಜ౲ ದ ಎಪ౭ ౱ൢ ರඡ ವಷბದย౵  ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ౲  เඋನ෱ಡಲൽಂದ ಈ 
෨ಂൽඦ൤ ಅඌඛಯ෦ತ฿ಗತಕౙ ൿ౪ :-  

 1. ๸౾౹ ಪ౨  ກಸฆ ಮൡ౨  ඩ౳ ฏಭ.- (1) ಈ ಅඌඛಯಮವඝ౬  ಕකბಟಕ 
เඋನ෱ಡಲದವರ ๸ಬಳಗำ, ඛไൟ౨  ๆತನಗำ ಮൡ౨  ಭ൤౲ ಗಳ  (ൟൿ౪ ಪല) ಅඌඛಯಮ, 2022 
ಎಂൿ ಕฉಯತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 (2) ಇൿ 2022ರ ಏඪ౳ ฯ 1ඡ ൽකಂಕൽಂದ ೦คಡ ಬರತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 2. 3ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ಕකბಟಕ เඋನ෱ಡಲದವರ ๸ಬಳಗำ, ඛไൟ౨  
ๆತನಗำ ಮൡ౨  ಭ൤౲ ಗಳ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1956ರ (1957ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ 2) (ಇย౵  ಇඝ౬ ෨ಂං 
෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮๅಂൿ ಉว౵ ೕ಍ಸมಜං) 3ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ ,-   

 (i) (1)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵  “ಐವൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ'' ಎಂಬ ಪದಗัಡ ``ಎಪ౭ ൤౨ ೖൿ ๬เರ 
งඩ෵ಗಳ'' ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಮൡ౨  `` ෩ฆ ಲౘ งඩ෵ಗಳ'' ಎಂಬ ಪದಗัಡ ``කฤౙ  ಲౘ 
งඩ෵ಗಳ'' ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 (ii) (2)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵  “ಐವൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ'' ಎಂಬ ಪದಗัಡ ``ಎಪ౭ ൤౨ ೖൿ 
๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ'' ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಮൡ౨  `` ෩ฆ ಲౘ งඩ෵ಗಳ'' ಎಂಬ ಪದಗัಡ 
``කฤౙ  ಲౘ งඩ෵ಗಳ'' ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 3. 4ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 4ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵  (1)ඡ 
ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵   `` ಎಂಬൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ'' ಎಂಬ ಪದಗัಡ "ಒಂൿ ಲౘದ ಅರವൡ౨  ๬เರ 
งඩ෵ಗಳ'' ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; ಮൡ౨   

 4. 5ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 5ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (2)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵   
``ಒಂൿ ๬เರ'' ಎಂಬ ಪದಗัಡ ``ಎರഴ ๬เರ'' ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  

 5. 6ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 6ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (1)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (ಎ) 
ಘಡದย౵ , `` ಒಂൿ ๬เರ'' ಎಂಬ ಪದಗัಡ ``ಎರഴ ๬เರ'' ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  
ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  

 



2 

 
  6. 8ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 8ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (2)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ ,- 

 (i) (෈) ಘಡದย౵  "෩ವൡ౨  งඩ෵" ಎಂಬ ಪದಗัಡ ``ನಲವൡ౨  งඩ෵" ಎಂಬ 
ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  

 (ii) (ല) ಘಡದย౵  "ಎರഴ ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ" ಎಂಬ ಪದಗัಡ "෩ฆ ๬เರ 
งඩ෵ಗಳ" ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  

 (iii) ෮ದಲඡ ಪฏൡಕದย౵   "ಎರഴ ๬เರ ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩ෵ಗำ  ಮൡ౨  ಐൿ 
๬เರ งඩ෵ಗำ”ಎಂಬ ಪದಗัಡ "෩ฆ ๬เರದ ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩ෵ಗำ ಮൡ౨  ಏำ 
๬เರ งඩ෵ಗำ" ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  

 7. 10ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 10ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ ,- 

 (i)  (1)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵  ``ನಲವൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ'' ಎಂಬ ಪದಗัಡ "ಅರವൡ౨  
๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ'' ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  

 (ii) (2)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵  "ಒಂൿ ๬เರ ยೕಟฑ" ಎಂಬ ಪದಗัಡ "ಒಂൿ ๬เರದ ಐൿ 
ඞฆ ยೕಟฑ'' ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 8. 10ಎ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 10ಎ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ ,- 

 (i)  (1)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵   ``ನಲವൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ'' ಎಂಬ ಪದಗัಡ "ಅರವൡ౨  
๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ'' ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  

 (ii) (2)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵  ``ನಲವൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ'' ಎಂಬ ಪದಗัಡ "ಅರವൡ౨  
๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ'' ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 9. 10ല ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 10ല ಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵  (1)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದ 
(ಎ) ಘಡದย౵   ``ಏำ ඞฃ ಐವൡ౨  ยೕಟฑ'' ಎಂಬ ಪದಗัಡ “ಒಂൿ ๬เರದ ಐൿඞฆ ยೕಟฑ'' 
ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  

 10. 10ಇ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 10ಇ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ , ``ನಲವൡ౨  ๬เರ 
งඩ෵ಗಳ'' ಎಂಬ ಪದಗัಡ "ಅರವൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ'' ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  
ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  

 11. 10೧ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 10೧ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (2)ඡ 
ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵  "ಒಂൿ ๬เರ ยೕಟฑ" ಎಂಬ ಪದಗัಡ "ಎರഴ ๬เರ ยೕಟฑ'' ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  
ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 12. 10ಐ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 10ಐ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (1)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದ 
(ಎ) ಘಡದย౵ , ``ಏำ ඞฃ ಐವൡ౨  ยೕಟฑ'' ಎಂಬ ಪದಗัಡ ”ಒಂൿ ๬เರದ ಐൿ ඞฆ 
ยೕಟฑ'' ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  

 13.10೬ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 10೬ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ , ``෩ವ൤౨ ೖൿ 
๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ'' ಎಂಬ ಪದಗัಡ "ಐವൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ'' ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  
ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  

 14. 10ಃ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 10ಃ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ , ``෩ವ൤౨ ೖൿ 
๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ'' ಎಂಬ ಪದಗัಡ "ಐವൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ'' ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  
ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  



3 

 
 15. 10ಎฯ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 10ಎฯ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (2)ඡ 
ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵  "ಒಂൿ ๬เರ ยೕಟฑ" ಎಂಬ ಪದಗัಡ "ಒಂൿ ๬เರದ ಐൿ ඞฆ ยೕಟฑ'' 
ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 16. 10ಎಂ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 10ಎಂ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (2)ඡ 
ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ , "ಒಂൿ ๬เರ ยೕಟฑ" ಎಂಬ ಪದಗัಡ "ಒಂൿ ๬เರದ ಐൿ ඞฆ ยೕಟฑ'' 
ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 17. 10ಎඨ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 10ಎඨ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (1)ඡ ಉಪ 
ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (ಎ) ಘಡದย౵  ``ಏำ ඞฃ ಐವൡ౨  ยೕಟฑ'' ಎಂಬ ಪದಗัಡ ”ಒಂൿ ๬เರದ ಐൿ 
ඞฆ ยೕಟฑ'' ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  

 18. 11ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 11ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (1)ඡ ಉಪ 
ಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ , ``ಇಪ౭ ൤౨ ೖൿ ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ'' ಎಂಬ ಪದಗัಡ "ನಲವൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ'' 
ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  

 19. 11ಎ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 11ಎ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (1)ඡ 
ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ ,- 

 (i) " ನಲವൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ" ಎಂಬ ಪದಗัಡ "ಐವൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ" ಎಂಬ 
ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

 (ii)  ಎಂಟඡ ಪฏൡಕದ ತฆ฿ಯ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ๳คಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

 "ಅಲ౵ ඃ ಪฏൡ, ෴่ಬ౯  ವ౲ ౾౨ ෷ ಐൿ ವಷბಗัಜಂತ ກ೉౞ ನ ๳ๅಯඝ౬  ಸย౵ ๭ฆವ 
๸ದಭბದย౵  ಆತඛಡ ತದඦತರದ ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಂൿ තಣბತಂಡ ವಷბಃౙ  ಪ౳ ൟ ൟಂಗัಡ ಐൿ ๬เರ 
งඩ෵ಗಳ ದರದย౵  ກೋ౞ ವค ඛไൟ౨  ๆತನವඝ౬  ๸ർಯ ෥ಡತಕౙ ൿ౪  ಅൿ ಒಂൿ ಲౘ 
งඩ෵ಗಳඝ౬  ෦ೕರತಕౙ ದ౪ ಲ౵ ." 

  20. 11๭ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 11๭ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ ,-  

 (i)  (1)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵   ``ಎರഴ ಲౘ งඩ෵ಗಳ'' ಎಂಬ ಪದಗัಡ   "ಎರഴ ಲౘದ 
ಐವൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ'' ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  

 (ii) (2)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵  ``ಎರഴ ಲౘ งඩ෵ಗಳ'' ಎಂಬ ಪದಗัಡ   "ಎರഴ ಲౘದ 
ಐವൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ'' ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  

 21. 11ല ຄಸ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ๳ಪბഷ.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 11๭ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ತฆ฿ಯ ಈ 
෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ๳คಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:-  

 “11ല. ಸූಪൟ, ಸූಧ౲ ౘ, ಉಪಸූಪൟ, ಉಪಸූಧ౲ ౘ, เฌೕಧ ಪౘದ කಯಕฆ, 
ಸ౽ბค ෨ಖ౲  ಸ೏ತಕฆ ಮൡ౨  เฌೕಧಪౘಗಳ ෨ಖ౲  ಸ೏ತಕರ ๸ಬಳ ಮൡ౨  
ಭ൤౲ ಗಳย౵  ກಚ౞ ಳ.- ಸූಪൟ, ಸූಧ౲ ౘ, ಉಪಸූಪൟ, ಉಪಸූಧ౲ ౘ, เฌೕಧ ಪౘದ කಯಕฆ, 
ಸ౽ბค ෨ಖ౲  ಸ೏ತಕฆ ಮൡ౨  เฌೕಧಪౘಗಳ ෨ಖ౲  ಸ೏ತಕರ ๸ಬಳ ಮൡ౨  ಭ൤౲ ಗಳඝ౬  
ಆർಯ ൤คಡ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1961ರ 48ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ เವರൕಯ (v)ඡ ಘಡದ ಅലಯย౵  
ಉಪීඌಸมದ ෍ว ಏคಃ ๰ಚ౲ ಂಕದ ಆඋರದ ෬ว 1ඡ ಏඪ౳ ฯ 2023คಂದ ඩ౳ ฏಭ฿ಜ ಪ౳ ൟ 
ಐൿ ವಷბಗัಡ ກಚ౞ ಳ ෥ಡತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 22. 12ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 12ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ ,- 

 (i)  (ಎ) ಘಡದย౵  "ಇಪ౭ ൤౨ ೖൿ งඩ෵ಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗัಡ “෩ವ൤౨ ೖൿ งඩ෵ಗำ” 
ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 



4 

 
 (ii) (෈) ಘಡದ (i)ඡ ಉಪಘಡದย౵  “ಎರഴ ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗำ”, “ಎರഴ ๬เರದ ಐൿ 
ඞฆ งඩ෵ಗำ”, “ಐൿ ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗำ” ಮൡ౨  “ಒಂൿ ๬เರದ ಐൿ ඞฆ 
งඩ෵ಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗัಡ “ಎರഴ ๬เರ ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩ෵ಗำ”, “෩ฆ ๬เರದ ಐൿ 
ඞฆ งඩ෵ಗำ”, “ಏำ ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗำ” ಮൡ౨  “ಎರഴ ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗำ” ಎಂಬ 
ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಅඝಕ౳ ಮ฿ಜ ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 (iii) (๭๭) ಘಡದย౵ , “ನಲವൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗัಡ “ಅರವൡ౨  ๬เರ 
งඩ෵ಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ .   

 (iv) (๭๭๭) ಘಡದย౵ , “ಎರഴ ಲౘ งඩ෵ಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗัಡ “ಎರഴ ಲౘದ ಐವൡ౨  
๬เರ งඩ෵ಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ .    

 (v) (ಎೖ) ಘಡದย౵ ,- 

 (ಎ) (ii)ඡ ಉಪಘಡದย౵  “ನಲವൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗัಡ “ಅರವൡ౨  ๬เರ 
งඩ෵ಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ .   

 (෈) (iv)ඡ ಉಪಘಡದย౵  “ಹൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗัಡ “ಇಪ౭ ൡ౨  ๬เರ 
งඩ෵ಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ .   

 

 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 



5 

 
ಉං౪ ೕಶಗำ ಮൡ౨  ౽ರಣಗಳ ຂัಃ 

 

 ೧ೕವನ ๅಚ౞ ದย౵  ಗಣඛೕಯ ກಚ౞ ಳ฿ಜฆತ౨ ං. ಆದ౪ คಂದ ಕකბಟಕ เඋನ ෱ಡಲದವರ 

๸ಬಳ, ඛไൟ౨  ๆತನಗಳ ಮൡ౨  ಭ൤౲ ಗಳ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1956ඝ౬  (1957ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ 2) 

ൟൿ ಪല ෥ഴವ ෩ಲಕ ๸ಸൽೕಯ ౽ಯბඛ฿ბಹಕರ ಮൡ౨  ๎ಸಕರ ๸ಬಳಗಳඝ౬  ಮൡ౨  

ಭ൤౲ ಗಳඝ౬  ๻ಟ ಃಲโ ಇತರ ಪ౳ ෽ೕಜನಗಳඝ౬  ກ೉౞ ๯โൿ ಅವಶ౲ ಕๅಂൿ ಪคಗ൐ಸมಜං.  

 ಆದ౪ คಂದ ಈ เඒಯಕ. 
 

 

 

 

 

  

 



6 

 
ಆ൮ბಕ ೦ౢ ಪನ ಪತ౳  

 

 ಪ౳ ๬౨ เತ ๎ಸකತ౱ ಕ ಕ౳ ಮൽಂದ ฿๞ბಕ฿ಜ ๯෥ฆ   67  ಆೕഔ   งඩ෵ಗಳ 

ກೋ౞ ವค ಆವತბಕ ๅಚ౞  ಉಂഓಞತ౨ ං. 

 

 

eÉ.¹. ªÀiÁzsÀÄ¸Áé«Ä 

PÁ£ÀÆ£ÀÄ, ¸ÀA¸À¢ÃAiÀÄ ªÀåªÀºÁgÀUÀ¼ÀÄ ªÀÄvÀÄÛ  

±Á À̧£À gÀZÀ£É ºÁUÀÆ À̧tÚ ¤ÃgÁªÀj ªÀÄAwæ 

 

 

JA.PÉ. «±Á¯ÁQë 

PÁAiÀÄðzÀ²ð(¥Àæ) 

PÀ£ÁðlPÀ «zsÁ£À ¸À̈ sÉ 

 

 

 

 



7 

 
ಅඝීಧ 

ಕකბಟಕ เඋನ ෱ಡಲದ ๸ಬಳಗำ, ඛไൟ౨  ๆತನಗำ ಮൡ౨  ಭ൤౲ ಗಳ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 
1956ರ (1957ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ ๸ಒ౲  2) ಉದ౫ ೃತ ූಗ 

xx   xx  xx 

 3. ಸූಪൟ ಮൡ౨  ಸූಧ౲ ౘರ ๸ಬಳಗำ ಮൡ౨  ಆൟಥ౲  ಭ൤౲ ಗำ.- (1) ಸූಪൟಡ ಒಂൿ 
ൟಂಗัಡ  ಐವൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ ๸ಬಳ ಮൡ౨  ಒಂൿ ವಷბಃౙ  ෩ฆ ಲౘ งඩ෵ಗಳ 
ಆൟಥ౲  ಭ൤౲ ಯඝ౬  ๸ർಯ ෥ಡತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 (2) ಸූಧ౲ ౘคಡ ಒಂൿ ൟಂಗัಡ  ಐವൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ ๸ಬಳ ಮൡ౨  ಒಂൿ ವಷბಃౙ  
෩ฆ ಲౘ งඩ෵ಗಳ ಆൟಥ౲  ಭ൤౲ ಯඝ౬  ๸ർಯ ෥ಡತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 4. ಸූಪൟಯವฆ, ಸූಧ౲ ౘರ ෨ಂ൞ದವರ ฿ಸದ ಮචಗำ.- (1) ಸූಪൟಯವฆ, 
ಸූಧ౲ ౘฆ, ಉಪಸූಪൟಯವฆ, ಉಪಸූಧ౲ ౘฆ, เฌೕಧಪౘದ ෨ಘಡฆ, ಸ౽ბರದ ෨ಖ౲  
ಸ೏ತಕฆ ಮൡ౨  เฌೕಧಪౘದ ෨ಖ౲  ಸ೏ತಕฆ, ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಬ౯ ฆ ತಮ౱  ಅඌ౽ರದ ಅವඌ තൟბ 
ಮൡ౨  ಅದರ ඛಕಟ ತฆ฿ಯದ  ಅರವൡ౨  ൽವಸಗಳ ಅವඌಯ ౽ಲ ෍ಂಗิฆ ನಗರ ಅಥ฿ 
෍ಂಗิฆ ನಗರದ ಪค෦ൟಗัಂದ ෩ವൡ౨  ౾สೕ෦ೕಟฑ ಒಳಡ ಒಂൿ ๯ಸ೧ౠ ತ ಮචಯඝ౬  
෇ലಡ ๸ർಯ ෥ಡං ಬಳಸฤ ಹಀౙ ಳ౶ ವฃಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪ . ಅಥ฿ ಅಂಥ ๯ಸ೧ౠ ತ ಮචಡ ಬದมಜ 
ൟಂಗัಡ ಎಂಬൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ ದರದย౵  ಮච ෇ലಡ ಭತ౲ ಃౙ  ಹಀౙ ಳ౶ ವฃಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪ . ಈ 
ಉಪ-ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ෬ฉಡ ಒದಜ๭ದ ฿ಸದ ಮචಯඝ౬  ඛಯ෦ಸมඈಥ ๔౳ ೕ൐ಗಳย౵  
๯ಸ೧ౠ ತತัಸತಕౙ ൿ౪  ಮൡ౨  ಅದರ ඪ౵ ಂ൬ เ๭౨ ೕಣბโ ඛಯ෦ಸมඈಥ ෦ൟಗಳඝ౬  
෦ೕರತಕౙ ದ౪ ಲ౵ . 

xx   xx  xx 

 5. ಸූಪൟ ಮൡ౨  ಸූಧ౲ ౘರ ฿ಹನ ๷ಲಭ౲ .- (1) xx   xx  xx 

(2) ಸූಪൟ ಮൡ౨  ಸූಧ౲ ౘคಡ ಸ౽ბರโ ಪ౳ ൟ ൟಂಗำ  ಒಂൿ ๬เರ ยೕಟฑ දജ౳ ೕฯ ದರಗಳ 
ๅಚ౞ ಃౙ  ಸಮකದ ฿ಹನ ಭ൤౲ ಯඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಬ౯ คಟ ๸ർಯ ෥ಡತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

xx   xx  xx 

 6. ಸූಪൟ ಮൡ౨  ಸූಧ౲ ౘฆ ಮൡ౨  ಸ౽ბರโ ๸ർಯ ෥ಡ෎౽ದ 
ೈ೩ბಗำ.- (1) ಸූಪൟ ಮൡ౨  ಸූಧ౲ ౘฆ ಅವฆಗಳ ಉಪ෽ೕಗ౽ౙ ಜ 4ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (1)ඡ 
ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣ ಮൡ౨  5ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ಅലಯย౵  ಅವฆಗัಡ ງ೉ಃ෴ದ ඛ฿ಸಗัಡ ಮൡ౨  
෮ೕഓฆ ౽ฆಗัಡ ๸ීඌ๭ඈ൤ ಅವฆಗำ ಈ ෨ಂൽನ ೈ೩ბಗಳඝ౬  ๸ർಯ ෥ಡฤ 
ಬದ౫ ฃಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

 (ಎ) ಸ౽ბರโ ๸ർಯ ෥ഴವ ಒಂൿ ๬เರ ยೕಟฆಗಳ දജ౳ ೕฤ ๅಚ౞ ಃౙ  
ກೋ౞ ವค෴ದ දജ౳ ೕฤ ๅಚ౞ ; ಮൡ౨  

xx   xx  xx 

 8. ಪ౳ ฿ಸದ ෬ยฆ฿ಗ ಸූಪൟ, ಉಪ-ಸූಪൟ, ಸූಧ౲ ౘ, ಉಪ-ಸූಧ౲ ౘ, 
เฌೕಧ ಪౘದ කಯಕฆ, ಸ౽ბค ෨ಖ౲  ಸ೏ತಕฆ ಮൡ౨  เฌೕಧ ಪౘದ ෨ಖ౲  
ಸ೏ತಕฆ - ಇವฆಗಳ ಪ౳ ෴ಣ ಭ൤౲  ಮൡ౨  ಇತರ ಭ൤౲ ಗำ.- (1) xx   xx  xx 

 (2) ූರತದ ಒಳಡ ಪ౳ ฿ಸ ෥ഴ฿ಗ, ಸූಪൟ, ಉಪ-ಸූಪൟ, ಸූಧ౲ ౘ ಮൡ౨  ಉಪ-
ಸූಧ౲ ౘ, เฌೕಧ ಪౘದ කಯಕฆ ಸ౽ბค ෨ಖ౲  ಸ೏ತಕ ಮൡ౨  เฌೕಧ ಪౘದ ෨ಖ౲  
ಸ೏ತಕฆ- ಇವฆ,- 

 (ಎ) xx   xx  xx 



8 

 
 (෈) ರ๲౨ ಯ ෩ಲಕ ಪ౳ ෴ಣ ෥ലർಗ ಪ౳ ൟ ౾สೕ෦ೕಟคಡ ෩ವൡ౨  งඩ෵ ರ๲౨  
෭ฤ ದರಃౙ  ಹಀౙ ಳ౶ ವฃಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

xx   xx  xx 

  (ല) ಪ౳ ෴ಣದ ൽನಗัಛಜ ಮൡ౨  ෴โඃ ಸ౩ ಳದย౵  ಉัൿಆำ౶ ವ ಪ౳ ൟൽನಃౙ  ಎರഴ 
๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ ൽನಭ൤౲ ಗัಡ ಹಀౙ ಳ౶ ವฃಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪ : 

 ಪฏൡ, ฃಜ౲ ದ ຄರಡ ෥ഴವ ಪ౳ ฿ಸಗಳ ๸ದಭბಗಳย౵  ಪ౳ ෴ಣದ ൽನಗัಡ ಮൡ౨  
෴โඃ ಸ౩ ಳದย౵  ಉัൿಆำ౶ ವ ಪ౳ ൟ ൽನಃౙ  ಎರഴ ๬เರದ ಐඞฆ งඩ෵ಗำ ಮൡ౨  
ಐൿ ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗำ ൽನಭ൤౲ ෴ಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪ : 

xx   xx  xx 

 10. ಉಪ-ಸූಪൟ ಮൡ౨  ಉಪ-ಸූಧ౲ ౘರ ๸ಬಳಗำ.-  (1) ಉಪ-ಸූಪൟ ಮൡ౨  ಉಪ-
ಸූಧ౲ ౘ ಈ ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಬ౯ คಟ ൟಂಗัಡ ನಲವൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ ๸ಬಳವඝ౬  ๸ർಯ 
෥ಡತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 (2) ಉಪ-ಸූಪൟ ಮൡ౨  ಉಪ-ಸූಧ౲ ౘ ಈ ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಬ౯ คಟ, ಪ౳ ൟ ൟಂಗัಡ, ಒಂൿ ๬เರ 
ยೕಟฑ දജ౳ ೕฯ ෍วಡ ಸಮකದ ฿ಹನ ಭತ౲ ವඝ౬  ๸ർಯ ෥ಡತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 10ಎ. ಉಪ-ಸූಪൟ, ಉಪ-ಸූಧ౲ ౘ ಅಥ฿ ಸූಪൟ ಅಥ฿ ಸූಧ౲ ಋಷರ 
ಕತბವ౲ ಗಳඝ౬  ඛವბ๼๯ವ ವ౲ ౾౨ ಡ ๸ർಯ ෥ಡ෎౽ದ ๸ಬಳ, ฿ಹನ ಮൡ౨  ฿ಹನ 
ಭ൤౲ .- (1) ಈ ಅඌඛಯಮದย౵  ಏඡ ಇದ౪ ง, ಸූಪൟಯ ๬౩ ನโ ಌย ಇർ౪ ಗ ಮൡ౨  ಸದค ๬౩ ನದ 
ಕತბವ౲ ಗಳඝ౬  ಉಪ-ಸූಪൟ ಅಥ฿ ๸เඋನದ 184ඡ ಅඝ೎౟ ೕದದ (1) ಘಡದ ෬ฉಡ ඡಮಕ 
෥ലದ เඋನ ಪคಷൟ౨ ನ ಸದಸ౲ ฌಬ౯ ฆ ඛವბ๼๭ದฉ, ಉಪ-ಸූಪൟ ಅಥ฿ ಅಂಥ ಸದಸ౲ คಡ 
ಅವฆ ๻ಡ ಕತბವ౲  ඛವბ๼๭ದ ಅವඌಛಜ ಪ౳ ൟ ൟಂಗัಡ ನಲವൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ 
๸ಬಳವඝ౬  ๸ർಯ ෥ಡತಕౙ ൿ౪  ಮൡ౨  ๰ಕ౨  ෮ೕഓฆ ౽ฆ ಒದಜಸತಕౙ ൿ౪  ಮൡ౨  5 ಮൡ౨  
6ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣಗಳ ಉಪීಧಗಳ ಅඝ๬ರ ฿ಹನ ಭತ౲ ವඝ౬  ๸ർಯ ෥ಡತಕౙ ൿ౪ : 

 (2) ಈ ಅඌඛಯಮದย౵  ಏඡ ಇದ౪ ง, ಸූಧ౲ ౘನ ๬౩ ನโ ಌย ಇർ౪ ಗ ಮൡ౨  ಆ ಌย 
๬౩ ನದ ಕತბವ౲ ಗಳඝ౬  ಉಪ-ಸූಧ౲ ౘ ಅಥ฿ ๸เඋನದ 180ඡ ಅඝ೎౟ ೕದದ (1)ඡ ಘಡದ 
෬ฉಡ ඡಮಕತಂഽಥ เඋನಸොಯ ಸದಸ౲ ฌಬ౯ ฆ ඛವბ๼๭ದฉ ಅಂಥ ಕತბವ౲ ಗಳඝ౬  ಅವฆ 
ඛವბ๼๭ದ ಅಂಥ ಅವඌಛಜ ಅವคಡ ಪ౳ ൟ ൟಂಗัಡ ನಲವൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ ๸ಬಳ ๸ർಯ 
෥ಡತಕౙ ൿ౪  ಮൡ౨  ๰ಕ౨  ෮ೕഓฆ ౽ರඝ౬  ಒದಜಸತಕౙ ൿ౪  ๻ಟ 5 ಮൡ౨  6ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ 
ಉಪීಧಗಳ ಅඝ๬ರ ฿ಹನ ಭತ౲ ವඝ౬  ๸ർಯ ෥ಡತಕౙ ൿ౪ : 

xx   xx  xx 

 10ല. ಉಪ-ಸූಪൟ ಮൡ౨  ಉಪ-ಸූಧ౲ ౘರ ๻ಟ ಸ౽ბರ ๸ർಯ ෥ಡ෎౽ದ 
ๅಚ౞ ಗำ.- (1) ಉಪ-ಸූಪൟ ಮൡ౨  ಉಪ-ಸූಧ౲ ౘฆ 4ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (1)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣ ಮൡ౨  10๭ 
ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ෬ฉಡ ಅವರ ಬಳಃಛಜ ງ೉ಃ ෥ಡมದ ฿ಸದ ಮච ಮൡ౨  ෮ೕഓฆ ౽ฆಗಳ 
๸ීಧದย౵  ಈ ෨ಂൽನ ๅಚ౞ ಗಳඝ౬  ๸ർಯ ෥ಡฤ ಬದ౫ ฃಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

  (ಎ) ಸ౽ბರโ ๸ർಯ ෥ലದ ಏำ ඞฃ ಐವൡ౨  ยೕಟฑ දജ౳ ೕฯ ෍วಜಂತ ກೈ౞ ಜ 
ತಮ౱  ತಮ౱  ෮ೕഓฆ ౽ฆಗัಡ ಅಗತ౲ ฿ದ දജ౳ ೕฯ ෍ว; ಮൡ౨  

 10ಇ. เฌೕಧ ಪౘದ කಯಕನ ๸ಬಳ.- เฌೕಧ ಪౘದ ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಬ౯  කಯಕඛಡ ൟಂಗัಡ 
ನಲವൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ ๸ಬಳವඝ౬  ๸ർಯ ෥ಡತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

xx   xx  xx 



9 

 
 10೧. เฌೕಧ ಪౘದ කಯಕคಡ ฿ಹನ ๷ಲಭ౲ .- (1) ฃಜ౲  ಸ౽ბರโ ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಬ౯  
เฌೕಧ ಪౘದ කಯಕඛಡ ಬಳಸฤ ๰ಕ౨  ෮ೕഓฆ ౽ರඝ౬  ಒದಜಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

(2) ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಬ౯  เฌೕಧ ಪౘದ කಯಕඛಡ ಸ౽ბರโ ಪ౳ ൟ ൟಂಗำ ಒಂൿ ๬เರ ยೕಟฑ දജ౳ ೕฯ 
෍วಡ ಸಮකದ ฿ಹನ ಭ൤౲ ಯඝ౬  ๸ർಯ ෥ಡತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

xx   xx  xx 

 10ಐ. เฌೕಧ ಪౘದ කಯಕฆ ಮൡ౨  ಸ౽ბರ ๸ർಯ ෥ಡ෎౽ದ ๅಚ౞ ಗำ.- (1) 
ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಬ౯  เฌೕಧ ಪౘದ කಯಕඝ 4 ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (1)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣ ಮൡ౨  10೧ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ෬ฉಡ 
ಅವರ ಬಳಃಛಜ ງ೉ಃ ෥ಡมದ ฿ಸದ ಮච ಮൡ౨  ෮ೕഓฆ ౽คನ ๸ීಧದย౵  ಈ 
෨ಂൽನ ๑ಲౙ ಗಳඝ౬  ๸ർಯ ෥ಡฤ ಬದ౫ ฃಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

 (ಎ) ಸ౽ბರโ ๸ർಯ ෥ലದ ಏำඞฃ ಐವൡ౨  ยೕಟฑ දജ౳ ೕฯ ෍วಜಂತ ກೈ౞ ಜ 
ತಮ౱  ෮ೕഓฆ ౽ฆಗัಡ ಬಳ๭ದ දജ౳ ೕฯ ๅಚ౞ ; ಮൡ౨   

 10೬. ಸ౽ბค ෨ಖ౲  ಸ೏ತಕคಡ ๸ಬಳ.- ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಬ౯  ಸ౽ბค ಸ೏ತಕคಡ ൟಂಗัಡ 
෩ವ൤౨ ೖൿ ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ ๸ಬಳವඝ౬  ๸ർಯ ෥ಡತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 10ಃ. เฌೕಧ ಪౘದ ෨ಖ౲  ಸ೏ತಕರ ๸ಬಳ.- ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಬ౯  เฌೕಧ ಪౘದ ෨ಖ౲     
ಸ೏ತಕคಡ ൟಂಗัಡ ෩ವ൤౨ ೖൿ ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ ๸ಬಳವඝ౬  ๸ർಯ ෥ಡತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 10ಎฯ. ಸ౽ბค ෨ಖ౲  ಸ೏ತಕคಡ ฿ಹನ ๷ಲಭ౲ .- (1)     xx   xx  xx 

 (2) ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಬ౯  ಸ౽ბค ෨ಖ౲  ಸ೏ತಕඛಡ ಸ౽ბರโ ಪ౳ ൟ ൟಂಗำ ಒಂൿ ๬เರ ยೕಟฑ 
දജ౳ ೕฯ ෍วಡ ಸಮකದ ฿ಹನ ಭತ౲ ವඝ౬  ๸ർಯ ෥ಡತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 10ಎಂ. เฌೕಧ ಪౘದ ෨ಖ౲  ಸ೏ತಕคಡ ๬คಡ ವ౲ ವ๲౩ .- (1)     xx   xx  xx 

 (2) ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಬ౯  เฌೕಧ ಪౘದ ෨ಖ౲  ಸ೏ತಕคಡ ൟಂಗัಡ ಒಂൿ ๬เರ ยೕಟฑಗಳ දജ౳ ೕฯ 
ದರಃౙ  ಸಮකದ ๬คಡ ಭ൤౲ ಯඝ౬  ඛೕಡತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

xx   xx  xx 

 10ಎඨ. ಸ౽ბค ෨ಖ౲  ಸ೏ತಕ ಮൡ౨  เฌೕಧಪౘದ ෨ಖ౲  ಸ೏ತಕคಡ ಸ౽ბರโ 
๸ർಯ ෥ಡ෎౽ದ ๅಚ౞ ಗำ.- (1) ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಬ౯  ಸ౽ბค ෨ಖ౲  ಸ೏ತಕ ಮൡ౨  เฌೕಧಪౘದ 
෨ಖ౲  ಸ೏ತಕคಡ 4ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (1)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣ ಮൡ౨  ๸ದූბඝ๬ರ 10ಎฯ ಪ౳ ಕರಣ 
ಅಥ฿ 10ಎಂ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ෬ฉಡ, ಅವคಡ ງ೉ಃ ෥ಡมದ ฿ಸದ ಮච ಮൡ౨  ෮ೕഓฆ ౽คನ 
๸ීಧದย౵  ಈ ಃಳಡ ൟั๭ದ ๅಚ౞ ಗಳඝ౬  ๸ർಯ ෥ಡฤ ಬದ౫ ฃಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

 (ಎ) ಸ౽ბರโ ๸ർಯ ෥ലದ ಏำ ඞฃ ಐವൡ౨  ยೕಟฑ  දജ౳ ೕฯ ෍วಜಂತ ກೈ౞ ಜ 
ತಮ౱  ෮ೕഓฆ ౽ฆಗัಡ ಬಳ๭ದ දജ౳ ೕฯ ๅಚ౞ ; ಮൡ౨  

 

 11. เඋನಸො ಮൡ౨  เඋನ ಪคಷൟ౨ ನ ಸದಸ౲ ರ ๸ಬಳ.- (1) เඋನಸො ಅಥ฿ เඋನ 
ಪคಷൟ౨ ನ ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಬ౯  ಸದಸ౲ ඛಡ ൟಂಗัಡ ಇಪ౭ ൤౨ ೖൿ ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ ๸ಬಳವඝ౬  ๸ർಯ 
෥ಡತಕౙ ൿ౪ . ಆ ๸ಬಳโ ಅವರඝ౬  ಕ౳ ಮಬದ౫ ฿ಜ ೋක෵ಸมಜං ಎಂൿ ಳೕ๞๭ದ 
ൽකಂಕൽಂದ ಅವคಡ ඩ౳ ಪ౨ ฿ಗತಕౙ ൿ౪  ಅಥ฿ เඋನಸො ಅಥ฿ เඋನ ಪคಷൟ౨ ನย౵  ಌย 
๬౩ ನವඝ౬  ൡಂಬฤ ฃಜ౲ ඩಲคಂದ කಮඛඃბಶನ ෥ലದ ಸದಸ౲ ರ ๸ದಭბದย౵  ಅವರඝ౬  
๻ಡ කಮඛඃბಶನ ෥ലದ ൽකಂಕൽಂದ ಅಥ฿ ಌย๬౩ ನโ ಉಂഓಞವ ෮ದศ ಅಂಥ 
ಳೕಷൕ ಅಥ฿ කಮඛඃბಶನ ෥ലದ౪ ฉ ಆ ಌย๬౩ ನโ ಉಂഓದ ൽකಂಕൽಂದ ಅಂಥ 
๸ಬಳโ ඩ౳ ಪ౨ ฿ಗತಕౙ ൿ౪ : 

xx   xx  xx 



10 

 
 11ಎ. ಸದಸ౲ คಡ ඛไൟ౨  ๆತನ ಇ൞౲ ൽ.- (1)  ಕකბಟಕ เඋನ ෱ಡಲದವರ ๆತನಗำ, 
ඛไൟ౨  ๆತನಗำ ಮൡ౨  ಭ൤౲ ಗಳ (ൟൿ౪ ಪല) ಅඌඛಯಮ, 2009ರ ඩ౳ ฏಭದ ൽකಂಕൽಂದ ೦คಡ 
ಬฆ๋൤, 

 (i) เඋನ ಪคಷൟ౨ ನ ಒಬ౯  ಸದಸ౲ ฃಜ; ಅಥ฿ 

 (ii) เඋನಸොಯ ಒಬ౯  ಸದಸ౲ ฃಜ; ಅಥ฿ 

 (iii) ූಗಶ: เඋನಸොಯ ಸದಸ౲ ฃಜ ಮൡ౨  ූಗಶ: เඋನಪคಷൟ౨ ನ ಸದಸ౲ ฃಜ 

 - ಐൿ ವಷბಗಳವฉಡ ๳ๅ ಸย౵ ๭ದ ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಬ౯  ವ౲ ౾౨ ಡ, ಅವರ ಉัದ ೧ೕเ൞ವඌಯย౵  ಪ౳ ൟ 
ൟಂಗัಡ ನಲವൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ ದರದย౵  ඛไൟ౨  ๆತನವඝ౬  ๸ർಯ ෥ಡತಕౙ ൿ౪ : 

xx   xx  xx 

 ಅಲ౵ ඃ ಪฏൡ, ෴ช ವ౲ ౾౨  ಐൿ ವಷბಗัಜಂತ ກ೉౞ ನ ๳ๅ ಸย౵ ๭ർಗ, ඦತರದ 
තಣბತಂಡ ಪ౳ ൟ ವಷბಃౙ  ກೋ౞ ವค෴ಜ ಪ౳ ൟ ൟಂಗัಡ ಒಂൿ ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ ದರದย౵  
ກೋ౞ ವค ඛไൟ౨  ๆತನವඝ౬  ඩವൟಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

xx   xx  xx 

 11๭. ಆൟಥ౲  ಭ൤౲ .- (1) เฌೕಧ ಪౘದ කಯಕඛಡ ವಷბಃౙ  ಎರഴ ಲౘ งඩ෵ಗಳ ಆൟಥ౲  
ಭ൤౲  ๸ർಯ฿ಗತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 (2) ಉಪ-ಸූಪൟ, ಉಪ-ಸූಧ౲ ౘ, ಸ౽ბค ෨ಖ౲  ಸ೏ತಕ ಮൡ౨  เฌೕಧ ಪౘದ ෨ಖ౲  
ಸ೏ತಕ- ಇವคಡ ವಷბಃౙ  ಎರഴ ಲౘ งඩ෵ಗಳ ಆൟಥ౲  ಭತ౲  ๸ർಯ฿ಗತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

xx   xx  xx 

 12. เඋನಸූ ಸದಸ౲ ฆ ಮൡ౨  เඋನ ಪคಷ൬ನ ಸದಸ౲ ฆ - ಇವคಡ ಪ౳ ෴ಣ ಭ൤౲  
ಮൡ౨  ൽನಭ൤౲ ಗำ ಮൡ౨  ็ದ౲ ౾ೕಯ ಮൡ౨  ಇತฉ ๷ಲಭ౲ ಗำ.- ಈ ಅඌඛಯಮದ ෬ฉಡ 
ರ೉ಸมದ ඛಯಮಗಳ ෩ಲಕ ඛಧბคಸมඈಥ ಷರൡ౨ ಗัಡ ಒಳಪഖౣ ,- 

 (ಎ) เඋನಸො ಮൡ౨  เඋನ ಪคಷ൬ನ ಸದಸ౲ คಡ ಪ౳ ฿ಸಗัಡ ๸ීඌ๭ඈ൤ 
ඛಯ෦ಸมඈಥ ಷರൡ౨ ಗัಡ ಒಳಪഖౣ  ಅಥ฿ ౾สೕ෦ೕಟฆ ಆඋರದ ෬ว วಕౙ  ๻౾ದ 
ಪ౳ ෴ಣ ಭ൤౲ ಯ ಬದฤ ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಂൿ ಸොಡ ಒಂൿ ๬เರದ ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩ෵ಗಳ ඛಗൽ 
ಪ౳ ෴ಣ ಭ൤౲ ಯඝ౬ , ෴โඃ ಬಡಯ ಪ౳ ෴ಣ฿ಜರย ಅದಃౙ  ಪ౳ ൟ ౾สೕ෦ೕಟคಡ ಇಪ౭ ൤౨ ೖൿ 
งඩ෵ಗಳ ದರದย౵  ಪ౳ ෴ಣ ಭತ౲ โ ๸ർಯ฿ಗತಕౙ ൿ౪ . ಮൡ౨  ಎಲ౵  ಸದಸ౲ คಟ ಅವರ 
๻ಜฃൟ ಅವಶ౲ เฆವ ಸ౩ ಳಗಳย౵  ෇ലಡ ಇಲ౵ ං තಣბ฿ಜ ๯ಸ೧ౠ ತತಂಡ ವಸൟ ವ౲ ವ๲౩ ಯඝ౬  
ಸಹ ಒದಜಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . ಮൡ౨  ಅಂಥ ವಸൟ ವ౲ ವ๲౩ ಯඝ౬  ෥ಡൽฆವ ๸ದಭბದย౵  ಸದಸ౲ ඛಡ ಸොಯ 
ಅವඌಯ ಪ౳ ൟ ൽನಃౙ  ಮൡ౨  ಸො ඩ౳ ฏಭ฿ಞವ ෮ದยನ ಎರഴ ൽನಗำ ಮൡ౨  ಸො 
෨౽౨ ಯತಂಡ ඦತರದ ಎರഴ ൽನಗಳ ಅವඌಡ ಇಪ౭ ൤౨ ೖൿ งඩ෵ಗಳ ಭತ౲ ವඝ౬  ๸ർಯ 
෥ಡತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 (෈) ಎಲ౵  ಸದಸ౲ คಡ,- 

 (i) ಅವฆ ಸොಡ ๻ಜฃൿದ౽ౙ ಜ ಮൡ౨  ಸොಯ ನഴๅ ಬฆವ ಣฆ๻ಜคಯ ඛಯ෦๭ದ 
ಮಧ౲ ಂತರ ರ೦ൽನಗัಛಜ ฃಜ౲ ದ ಒಳಗഷ, ಪ౳ ൟ ൽನಃౙ  ಎರഴ ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗำ ಮൡ౨  
ූರತದย౵  ಇತರ ຄರ ฃಜ౲ ಗಳย౵ , ಪ౳ ൟ ൽನಃౙ  ಎರഴ ๬เರದ ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩ෵ಗಳ 
ൽನಭತ౲  ๸ർಯ฿ಗತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 (ii) ಎม౵  ಸದಸ౲ คಡ ಸො ඩ౳ ฏಭ฿ಞವ ಎರഴ ൽನಗಳ ෮ದฤ ಮൡ౨  ಸො ෨౽౨ ಯ฿ದ 
ඦತರದ ಎರഴ ൽನಗัಡ ൽನಭತ౲ โ ๸ർಯ฿ಗತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  



11 

 
 (๭) ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಬ౯  ಸದಸ౲  ಅಥ฿ ෥೧ ಸದಸ౲  ಮൡ౨  ಅವඣಂൽಡ ฿๭๯ವ ಅಥ฿ 
ಅವอ෈ತฃದ ಅವನ ಀഖಂಬದ ಸದಸ౲ ฆ,- 

 (๭๭) เඋನ ಸොಯ ಮൡ౨  เඋನ ಪคಷൟ౨ ನ ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಬ౯  ಸದಸ౲ ඝ, ೋකವ൏ ಃ౹ ೕತ౳  
ಪ౳ ෴ಣ ಭ൤౲ ෴ಜ ಪ౳ ൟ ൟಂಗัಡ ನಲವൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ ෮ಬಲಗඝ౬  
ඛಯ෦ಸಬ๾ർದ คೕൟಯย౵  ๭౷ ೕಕคಸฤ ಹಀౙ ಳ౶ ವකಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 (๭๭๭) ಸ೉ವ, ฃಜ౲  ಸ೉ವ, ಉಪ-ಸ೉ವ, ಸූಪൟ, ಸූಧ౲ ౘ, ಉಪ-ಸූಪൟ, ಉಪ-ಸූಧ౲ ౘ, 
เฌೕಧ ಪౘದ කಯಕ ,ಸ౽ბค ෨ಖ౲  ಸ೏ತಕ ಮൡ౨  เฌೕಧ ಪౘದ ෨ಖ౲  ಸ೏ತಕ ಇವง 
๳คඈ൤ ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಬ౯  ಸದಸ౲ ඝ, ಪ౳ ൟ ಹಣ౽๯ ವಷბದย౵ , ඛಯ෦ಸಬ๾ർඈಥ คೕൟಯย౵  
ಮൡ౨  ಅಂಥ ಷರൡ౨ ಗัಡ ಒಳಪഖౣ  ಒಂൿ ಅಥ฿ ກ೉౞ ನ ಪ౳ ෴ಣಗಳඝ౬  ಒಬ౯ ඡ ಆಗย ಅಥ฿ 
೯൤ಛರඣಂൽಡ ಆಗย ූರತದย౵  เ෥ನದม౵ ಗย ಅಥ฿ ซว౷ ಯ ෩ಲಕ ෴โඃ 
ದ೬ბಯย౵  ಪ౳ ෴ಣ ෥ಡฤ ಪ౳ ฿ಸದ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ಏඪ౳ ฯ ಮൡ౨  ಅಆౣ ೕಬฑ ൟಂಗัನย౵  ಎರഴ 
ಲౘ งඩ෵ಗಳඝ౬  ಎರഴ ಸ෥ನ ಉൡಗಳย౵  ಪഷൿಆಳ౶ ฤ ಹಀౙ ಳ౶ ವකಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪ . ಅಂಥ 
ಪ౳ ෴ಣಗಳඝ౬  ෥ലർಗ ಸದಸ౲ ฆ ಪ౳ ෴ಣ ಅಥ฿ ൽನಭ൤౲  ಪഷಯฤ 
ಹಀౙ ಳ౶ ವฃಜರತಕౙ ದ౪ ಲ౵ . 

xx   xx  xx 

 (ກೖ) ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಬ౯  ಸದಸ౲ ඛಟ ಈ ෨ಂൽನ ಭತ౲ ಗำ ๸ർಯ ฿ಗತಕౙ ൿ౪ ,- 

 (i) ඀ರ฿൐ ಮൡ౨  ෮ාฯ ಕฉಗัಛಜ ಅವඝ ಭค๭ದ ๅಚ౞ ಗัಛಜ ൟಂಗัಡ ಇಪ౭ ൡ౨  
๬เರ งඩ෵ಗำ; 

 (ii) ೋකವ൏ ಃ౹ ೕತ౳  ಭತ౲ ಗะಜ ನಲವൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵; 

 (iii) ಅಂ೎ ๅಚ౞ ಗಳ ๸ීಧ ಐൿ ๬เರ งඩ෵; 

 (iv) ಸದಸ౲ ඝ, ಸದಸ౲ කಜ ತನ౬  ಕತბವ౲ ಗಳඝ౬  ඛವბ๼ಸฤ ಆಪ౨  ಸ๻ಯಕඛಡ  ಮൡ౨  
งಂ෇ขಗಳ ๸ಬಳ ಎಂൿ ಹൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵. 

xx   xx  xx 

 

 

  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 

¸ÀPÁðj ªÀÄÄzÀæuÁ®AiÀÄ, «PÁ À̧¸ËzsÀ WÀlPÀ, ¨ÉAUÀ¼ÀÆgÀÄ, ¦7, PÁ¸ÀÆ , ¥ÀæwUÀ¼ÀÄ 500, 21£ÉÃ ¥sÉ§æªÀj 2021 



 
KARNATAKA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY 

FIFTEENTH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY  
TWELFTH SESSION 

THE KARNATAKA LEGISLATURE SALARIES, PENSIONS  
AND ALLOWANCES (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2022 

(LA Bill No. 06 of 2022) 
 

 A Bill further to amend the Karnataka Legislature Salaries, Pensions and  
Allowances Act, 1956. 

 Whereas it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Legislature Salaries, 
Pensions and Allowances Act, 1956 (Karnataka Act 2 of 1957) for the purposes 
hereinafter appearing; 

 Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the Seventy  third  year of 
the Republic of India, as follows:- 

 1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the 
Karnataka Legislature Salaries, Pensions and Allowances (Amendment) Act, 2022. 

 (2) It shall come into force with effect from 1st day of  April, 2022.  

2. Amendment of section 3.- In the Karnataka Legislature Salaries, 
Pensions and  Allowances Act, 1956 (Karnataka Act 2 of 1957), (hereinafter referred 
to as the Principal Act),  in section 3,-  

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words "fifty thousand rupees", the words 
"seventy five thousand rupees" and for the words "three lakhs rupees", 
the words  "four lakhs rupees" shall be substituted; 

(ii)  in sub section (2), for the words "fifty thousand rupees", the words " 
seventy five thousand rupees" and for the words "three lakhs rupees", 
the words  "four lakhs rupees" shall be substituted. 

3. Amendment of section 4. - In section 4 of the Principal Act, in sub-
section (1), for the words "eighty thousand rupees",  the words "one lakh sixty 
thousand rupees" shall be substituted. 

4. Amendment of section 5.- In section 5 of the Principal Act,  in sub-
section (2), for the words "one thousand", the words "two thousand" shall be 
substituted. 

5. Amendment of section 6.- In section 6 of the Principal Act,  in sub-
section (1),  in clause (a), for the words "one thousand", the words "two thousand " 
shall be substituted. 

6. Amendment of section 8.- In section 8 of the Principal Act, in sub  
section (2),- 

(i)   in clause (b), for the words "thirty rupees", the words "forty rupees" shall 
be substituted. 

(ii)    in clause (d), for the words "rupees two thousand", the words "rupees 
three thousand" shall be substituted. 

 



2 
 

 

(iii) in first proviso, for the words "two thousand five hundred rupees and 
five thousand rupees” the words “three thousand five hundred rupees 
and seven thousand rupees” shall be substituted. 

7. Amendment of section 10.- In section 10 of the Principal Act,- 

(i)    in sub-section (1), for the words "forty thousand rupees", the words "sixty  
thousand rupees" shall be substituted; 

(ii)   in sub-section (2), for the words "one thousand litres”, the words "one 
thousand five hundred litres" shall be substituted. 

8. Amendment of section 10A.- In section 10A of the Principal Act,- 

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words "forty thousand rupees", the words "sixty 
thousand rupees" shall be substituted. 

(ii) in sub-section (2), for the words "forty thousand rupees", the words "sixty  
thousand rupees" shall be substituted. 

9. Amendment of section 10D.- In section 10D of the Principal Act, in sub-
section (1) in clause (a) for the words "seven hundred and fifty litres” , the words 
"one thousand five hundred litres" shall be substituted. 

10. Amendment of section 10E.- In section 10E of the Principal Act, for the 
words "forty thousand rupees", the words "sixty thousand rupees" shall be 
substituted. 

11. Amendment of section 10G.- In section 10G of the Principal Act, in sub-
section (2), for the words "one thousand litres ", the words  "two thousand litres" 
shall be substituted. 

12. Amendment of section 10I.- In section 10I of the Principal Act, in sub-
section (1),in clause (a)  for the words "seven hundred and fifty litres”, the words 
"one thousand five hundred litres" shall be substituted. 

13. Amendment of section 10J.- In section 10J of the Principal Act, for the 
words "thirty five thousand rupees", the words "fifty  thousand rupees" shall be 
substituted. 

14. Amendment of section 10K.- In section 10K of the Principal Act, for the 
words " thirty five thousand rupees", the words "fifty  thousand rupees" shall be 
substituted. 

15. Amendment of section 10L.- In section 10L of the Principal Act, in sub-
section (2), for the words "one thousand  litres", the words "one thousand five 
hundred litres" shall be substituted. 

16. Amendment of section 10M.- In section 10M of the Principal Act, in 
sub-section (2), for the words "one thousand  litres", the words " one thousand five 
hundred litres" shall be substituted. 

17. Amendment of section 10N.- In section 10N of the Principal Act, in sub-
section (1), in clause (a) for the words "seven hundred and fifty litres”, the words 
"one thousand five hundred litres" shall be substituted. 

18. Amendment of section 11.- In section 11 of the Principal Act, in sub-
section (1), for the words "twenty five thousand rupees", the words "forty thousand 
rupees" shall be substituted. 



3 
 

 

19. Amendment of section 11A.- In section 11A of the Principal Act, in sub-
section (1),- 

(i) for the words “forty thousand rupees” the words “fifty thousand rupees” 
shall be substituted.  

 (ii) for the eighth proviso, the following shall be substituted, namely:- 

“Provided also that, where any person has served for more than five years 
there shall be paid to him an additional pension at the rate of rupees five 
thousand per mensem for every subsequent completed term  which shall 
not exceed  rupees one lakh.” 

20. Amendment of section 11C.- In section 11C of the Principal Act,- 

(i)  in sub-section (1), for the words "two lakh rupees", the words 
"two lakhs fifty thousand rupees" shall be substituted. 

(ii) in sub-section (2), for the words "two lakh rupees", the words 
"two lakhs fifty thousand rupees" shall be substituted. 

21. Insertion of new section 11D.- After section 11C of the Principal Act, 
the following shall be inserted, namely:- 

“11D. Increase in Salary and Allowances of the Chairman, the Speaker, 
the Deputy Chairman, the Deputy Speaker, the Leaders of Opposition, the 
Government Chief whips and the Opposition Chief Whips.-  The salary and 
allowances of the Chairman, the Speaker, the Deputy Chairman, the Deputy 
Speaker, the Leaders of Opposition, the Government Chief whips and the 
Opposition Chief Whips shall be increased after every five years commencing from 
1st April, 2023 on the basis of Cost Inflation Index provided under clause (v) of 
Explanation to section 48 of the Income-tax Act, 1961.” 

22. Amendment of section 12.- In section 12 of the Principal Act,- 

(i) in clause (a) for the words “twenty five rupees”  the words “thirty five  
rupees” shall be substituted.   

         (ii) in clause (b) in  sub-clause (i) for the words “two thousand rupees”, “two 
thousand five hundred rupees”, “five thousand rupees” and “one thousand five 
hundred rupees” the words “two thousand five hundred  rupees”, “three thousand 
five hundred rupees”, “seven thousand rupees” and “two thousand rupees” shall 
respectively be substituted.  

        (iii) in clause (cc) for the words “forty thousand rupees” the words “sixty 
thousand rupees” shall be substituted.  

(iv) in clause (ccc)  for the words “two lakh rupees” the words “two lakhs fifty 
thousand rupees” shall be substituted.  

         (v)  in clause (h),- 

 (a)   in sub-clause (ii) for the words “forty thousand rupees” the words “sixty 
thousand rupees” shall be substituted. 

 (b) in sub-clause (iv) for the words “ten thousand rupees” the words “twenty 
thousand rupees” shall be substituted.  

 

 



4 
 

 

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS 

 

There is a considerable increase in the cost of living. Therefore, it is 

considered necessary to enhance the salaries and allowances of the parliamentary 

functionaries and the legislators and certain other benefits by amending the 

Karnataka Legislature Salaries, Pensions and Allowances Act, 1956 (Karnataka  

Act 2 of 1957). 

 

Hence, the Bill. 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 



5 
 

 

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM 

 

 

 
 
 

 

 There will be a recurring approximate additional expenditure of Rs. 67   
crores per annum from the proposed legislative measure. 

 

                              
J.C. MADHU SWAMY 

Minister for Law, Parliamentary 
Affairs and Legislation and 

Minor Irrigation 
 
 

 
 

M.K. VISHALAKSHI 
Secretary (I/c) 

Karnataka Legislative Assembly 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



6 
 

 

ANNEXURE 

Extract from the Karnataka Legislature Salaries, Pensions and Allowances Act, 1956 

(Karnataka Act 2 of 1957) 

xx   xx   xx 

3. Salaries and sumptuary allowances of Chairman and Speaker.- (1) There shall 

be paid to the Chairman a salary of fifty thousand rupees per mensem and a sumptuary 

allowance of three lakhs rupees per annum. 

(2) There shall be paid to the Speaker a salary of fifty thousand rupees per mensem 

and a sumptuary allowance of three lakhs rupee per annum.  

xx   xx   xx 

4. Residences of Chairman, Speaker etc. .- (1) The  Chairman,. Speaker, Deputy 

Chairman, Deputy Speaker, Leader of Opposition, Government Chief Whip and Opposition 

Chief Whip each shall be entitled to the use of a furnished residence in the City of 

Bangalore within thirty kilometres from the limits of the City of Bangalore throughout his 

term of office and for a period of sixty days immediately thereafter, or, in lieu of such 

furnished residence, to a house rent allowance at the rate of eighty thousand rupees per 

mensem. The residence provided under this sub-section shall be furnished on such scales 

and the plinth area thereof shall not exceed such limits, as may be prescribed.  

(2) In a residence used by the Chairman or the Speaker, who is entitled to a house 

rent allowance in lieu of furnished residence, three rooms shall be furnished by the State 

Government on such scales as may be prescribed, to be used for official purposes. He shall 

be entitled for an allowance of ten thousand rupees per month for maintenance and upkeep 

of the residence and for layout and maintenance of gardens included in such residence. 

xx   xx   xx 

5. Conveyances of the Chairman and the Speaker.- (1) The State Government may 

provide a suitable motor car each for the use of the Chairman and the Speaker.  

(2) There shall be paid to the Chairman and the Speaker each a conveyance 

allowance equal to the cost of one thousand litres of petrol per mensem.  

xx   xx   xx 

6. Charges payable by the Chairman and the Speaker and the Government.- (1) 

The Chairman and the Speaker shall, in respect of their respective residences and the 

motor cars allotted for their use under sub-section (1) of section 4 and section 5, be liable 

to pay the following charges, namely:—  



7 
 

 

(a) cost of petrol required for their respective motor cars in excess of the cost of one 

thousand litres litres of petrol paid by the Government; and 

xx   xx   xx 

8. Travelling and other allowances of the Chairman, the Deputy Chairman, the 

Speaker and the 1[Deputy Speaker, the Leaders of the Opposition ,the Government 

Chief Whips and the Opposition Chief Whips on tours.- (1)  

xx  xx   xx 

(2) While touring inside India]1the Chairman, the Deputy Chairman, the Speaker 

and the Deputy Speaker, the Leaders of the Opposition,the Government Chief Whips and 

the Opposition Chief Whips shall be entitled,—  

xx   xx   xx 

(b) for journeys by road, to road mileage at thirty  rupees per kilometre; 

xx   xx   xx 

(d) to daily allowance at rupees two thousand per day for the days of journey and for 

the days of halt at any place:  

Provided that in the case of tours outside the State, the daily allowance shall be at 

two thousand five hundred rupees and five thousand rupees  per day for the days of 

journey and for the days of halt at any place: 

xx   xx   xx 

10. Salaries of Deputy Chairman and Deputy Speaker.- (1) There shall be paid to 

the Deputy Chairman and to the Deputy Speaker each a salary of forty thousand rupees 

per mensem. 

(2) There shall be paid to the Deputy Chairman and the Deputy Speaker a 

conveyance allowance of equal to the cost of one thousand litres of petrol per mensem. 

xx   xx   xx 

10A. Salary, conveyance and conveyance allowance payable to the Deputy 

Chairman, Deputy Speaker or the person performing the duties of the Chairman or 

Speaker.- (1) Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act, while the office of the 

Chairman is vacant and the duties of the said office are performed by the Deputy Chairman 

or a member of the Legislative Council appointed under clause (1) of Article 184 of the 

Constitution, the Deputy Chairman or such member, shall, during the period he so 

performs such duties, be paid a salary of forty thousand rupees per mensem and provided 



8 
 

 

with a suitable motor car and paid conveyance allowance in accordance with the provisions 

of sections 5 and 6: 

xx   xx   xx 

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act, while the office of the Speaker is 

vacant and the duties of the office are performed by the Deputy Speaker or member of the 

Legislative Assembly appointed under clause (1) of Article 180 of the Constitution, the 

Deputy Speaker or such member shall, during the period he so performs such duties, be 

paid salary of forty thousand rupees per mensem and provided with a suitable motor car 

and paid conveyance allowance in accordance with the provisions of sections 5 and 6: 

xx   xx   xx 

10D. Charges payable by the Deputy Chairman and the Deputy Speaker and the 

Government.- (1) The Deputy Chairman and the Deputy Speaker shall, in respect of their 

respective residences and the motor cars allotted for their use under sub-section (1) of 

section 4 and section 10C, be liable to pay the following charges, namely:—  

(a) cost of petrol required for their respective motor car in excess of the cost of seven 

hundred and fifty litres of petrol paid by the Government; and 

xx   xx   xx 

10E. Salary to the Leader of the Opposition.- There shall be paid to each Leader 

of the Opposition a salary of forty thousand rupees per mensem. 

xx   xx   xx 

10G. Conveyance for the Leader of the Opposition.- (1)  

xx  xx   xx 

 (2) There shall be paid to each Leader of the Opposition a conveyance allowance 

equal to the cost of one thousand  litres of petrol per mensem. 

10I. Charges payable by the Leader of the Opposition and the Government.- (1) 

Each Leader of the Opposition shall in respect of the residence and the motor car allotted 

for his use under sub-section (1) of section 4 and section 10G, be liable to pay the following 

charges, namely:—  

(a) cost of petrol required for their respective motor car in excess of the cost of seven 

hundred and fifty litres of petrol paid by the Government; and 

xx  xx   xx 

10J. Salary to the Government Chief Whip.- There shall be paid to each 

Government Chief Whip a salary of thirty five thousand rupees per mensem. 



9 
 

 

xx  xx   xx 

10K. Salary to the Opposition Chief Whip.- There shall be paid to each Opposition 

Chief Whip a salary of thirty five thousand rupees per mensem. 

xx  xx   xx 

10L. Conveyance for the Government Chief Whip.- (1) 

xx   xx   xx 

 (2) There shall be paid to each Government Chief Whip a conveyance allowance 

equal to the cost of one thousand  litres of petrol per mensem 

10M. Conveyance for the Opposition Chief Whip.- (1) 

       xx   xx   xx 

(2) There shall be paid to each Opposition Chief Whip a conveyance allowance equal 

to the cost of one thousand litres of petrol per mensem. 

       xx   xx   xx 

10N. Charges payable by the Government Chief Whip 2 [,and the Opposition 

Chief Whip.- (1) Each Government Chief Whip and each Opposition Chief Whip shall in 

respect of the residence and the motor car allotted for his use under sub-section (1) of 

section 4 and section 10L or section 10M, as the case may be, liable to pay]2 the following 

charges, namely:—  

(a) cost of petrol required for their respective motor cars in excess of the cost of seven 

hundred and fifty litres of petrol paid by the Government; and 

xx   xx   xx 

11. Salary of members of the Legislative Assembly and the Legislative Council.- 

(1) There shall be paid to every member of the Legislative Assembly or of the Legislative 

Council a salary of twenty five thousand rupees per mensem which shall accrue to him 

from the day on which he is declared duly elected, or, in the case of a member nominated 

by the Governor to fill a seat in the Legislative Assembly or the Legislative Council, from the 

date on which he is so nominated, or, if such declaration or nomination is made before the 

vacancy occurs, from the date of occurrence of the vacancy: 

       xx   xx   xx 

11A. Pension to the members etc.- (1) With effect from the date of commencement 

of the Karnataka Legislature Salaries, Pensions and Allowances (Amendment) Act, 2009 

there shall be paid to every person who has served for a period of five years as,- 

(i) a member of the Legislative Council; or  



10 
 

 

(ii)  a member of the Legislative Assembly; or 

(iii)   partly as a member of the Legislative Assembly and partly as a member of 

the Legislative Council, a pension at the rate of forty thousand rupees per 

mensem for the remainder of his life:  

xx   xx   xx 

Provided also that where any person has served for more than five years there shall 

be paid to him an additional pension at the rate of rupees one thousand per mensem for 

every subsequent completed year. 

Explanation.- For the purpose of this sub-section, a member of the Legislative 

Assembly or the Legislative Council includes,-  

(1) a person who prior to the 1st day of November 1956 represented any of the areas 

which with effect on and from the said date have become part of the new State of 

Karnataka, as a member of the Legislative Assembly or the Legislative Council of the State 

of which the said areas were part:  

Provided that in the case of a nominated member of the Legislative Assembly or the 

Legislative Council he shall be eligible for the pension if during his membership of the 

Legislative Assembly or the Legislative Council, he permanently resided in any area which 

forms part of the State of Karnataka.  

(2) a person who was a member of the following (before the first day of January, 

1952) namely:-  

(a) The Constituent Assembly;  

(b) The Mysore Representative Assembly;  

(c) The Mysore Legislative Assembly;  

(d) The Legislative Assembly or the Legislative Council of any State (including an 

Indian State) or Province,  

Which or any area of which now forms part of the State of Karnataka. Provided that 

no such pension shall be paid to a person unless,-  

(i) in the case of a person who served as a member representing a territorial 

Constituency, he represented; and  

(ii) in the case of any other member, he permanently resided during such 

membership in, any area which now forms part of the State of Karnataka. 

xx   xx   xx 



11 
 

 

11C. Sumptuary allowance.- (1) The Leaders of the Opposition shall be paid a 

sumptuary allowance of  two lakh rupees per annum. 

(2) The Deputy Chairman, the Deputy Speaker,the Government Chief Whips and the 

Opposition Chief Whips shall be paid a sumptuary allowance of two lakh rupees per 

annum. 

xx   xx   xx 

12. Travelling and daily allowances of, and medical  and other facilities to, 

members of the Legislative Assembly and the Legislative Council.- Subject to such 

conditions as may be determined by rules made under this Act,—  

(a) there shall be paid to the members of the Legislative Assembly and of the 

Legislative Council traveling allowance for journeys at the rate of twenty five rupees per kilo 

metre irrespective of mode of journey subject to such conditions as may be prescribed or 

fixed traveling allowance rupees one thousand five hundred for each meeting in lieu of 

traveling allowance calculated on the basis of distance traveled in kilometers. 

(b) there shall be paid,—  

(i) to all members daily allowance for attending the meetings and for the prescribed 

number of days of holidays, intervals or absence between meetings at the rate of two 

thousand rupees per-diem within the State and two thousand five hundred rupees and five 

thousand rupees per diem for stay in hotel or other registered establishment providing 

boarding and lodging at scheduled tariffs subject to production of bills and also one 

thousand five hundred rupees towards local transport per-diem outside the State in India; 

xx   xx   xx 

(cc) Every member of the Legislative Assembly and of the Legislative Council shall be 

entitled to receive in the prescribed manner, a sum of rupees forty thousand per month as 

constituency Traveling Allowance 

(ccc) Every member including a Minister, a Minister of State, a Deputy Minister, a 

Chairman, a Speaker, a Deputy Chairman, a Deputy Speaker, a Leader of the Opposition 

and a Government Chief Whip and a Opposition Chief Whip shall, for every financial year, 

be entitled to receive in such manner and subject to such conditions, as may be prescribed, 

a sum of rupees two lakh rupees in two equal instalments payable in the months of April 

and October for the purpose of travelling either single or with a companion in one or more 

journeys by air or by any class or by any railway in India. A member shall not be entitled to 

any travelling or daily allowance for such journeys. 

 xx   xx   xx 



12 
 

 

(h) every member shall be paid an allowance of,—  

(i) twenty thousand rupees per month towards meeting the expenditure incurred 

by him on telephone and cell phone calls; 

 (ii) forty thousand rupees per month as constituency allowances;  

(iii) five thousand rupees per month on postal charges;   

(iv) ten thousand rupees as the salary of the Personal Assistant and the Room Boy 

of the Member; in the discharge of his duties as a member 

Explanation.—For the purpose of this section, ‘meeting’ means a meeting of the 

Legislative Assembly or the Legislative Council or of any committee of the said Assembly or 

Council or of both. 

xx   xx   xx 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

  

 
 

 

Govt. Press, Vikasa Soudha, Bengaluru, 21at February, 2022, P7, W.D. , Copies 500 


