saa"aécsﬁe BRI ATI A
aﬁ&dwﬁc Dlaeld

BOFET IR TDOBOTRHT BoWTNRSH, 95,3, 3e3TNeH sH 3y, 33,ne

(3T F) AGCODF, 2022
(20223 eERPeH Deckhs B0,-06)

FOEEIT DGOTENOBOEET ROWFRY, 53,8, e33R a3, B3N DA,
1956 T, eI R, ST FE 30T 20T ITEODT.

PR, I, JOT TOWD TS NBLINLMEN TeeEdT LIPSO BOTRT
ROWFNY), 3y, eXIINED &I, 335NE LIPAODD, 195630, (19578 TOEEIT

SRDAOND 2) eI R, 3T e300 T ONIT.e00NTIHTWOOTT;

YT, IOV MEAT5T D&, BRI WRE B, TOEET U5 edPONOTBODOT &3
FN0DT03 L9 IZINIT, T, :-

1. RoBR, ®DBID DI, FTC0YP.- (1) B LRIRDNNEI, Tor&ds
LPOIENOTWOTIT BOWPNYD, a3y 8, 333N a03I), B3N (3TIE) 9P, 2022
DO FONIT,T),.

(2) BT 20223 £y 13 DV0TRDOT 207 WTIT,ED,.

2. 33¢ WTOPTE AW BR.- Toer&dT APOSNOBOTRT  ROWPNE, a3y,
HE3INY aNIY, B3N IRAOND, 19563 (19573 T €T IR0 2) (V). Y30,3000T3
TR 9PN OT V3 LNRESINT) 33 T3, -

(i) (1) NVTTTTLTE), “80233), AReIT TRTIONTF" 02 BBNPNT "d33,,3, 4730 AT
BRTIAINF" D02 BWRFI), &I, ~ aDRTY OF CRETONNF" 0 BWNENR Do), OF
BRTIAINT" D02 BIWRFI, &Ty3ABRERBAIT,,,.

(i) )3 NVTTTTRTW), "80a33), AT BRTICNNY" N0 JINLH “E,3, 4T3
A0e)T CRTIANNF" D0 BRNFI), aDI), ~ aDRTY OF TCRTAINE" D0W JBNENR
"R, OF G0N 0020 BWNRFN, )33 tRAIT,),.

3. 43¢ RTOT IS JBR.- DR  LRIRNNT 43¢ JZyF3R). (1)
NRVTTTHRA),  D0WIY, AT BRTIONTY" 02 BWNPT "WwOTY OFH 9T, )T
BRTANNY" D0 BWNPIN, B33 CBRIT,R,; NI,

4. 53¢ B30T STWHBR.- 30RO IRIONTNT 53¢ T)TTT (2)C VBT TTRTE).
"0 FIT" 0W WRNPN " dTT FoedT" 0L BWNPN,, &38RI T,T,.

5. 6:3¢ RBTFOHT 3WIRBR.- 2DR LIRICNENT 6:3¢ TWTTEIT (1) SVTBTTTEITI (o)
DOBR),  WOR AT D0W RBWINPR  "RTRBY  ARIT" D0 BBINY,
33 RCBRITT,,.



6. 8:3¢ BTV T 3TWI_JBR.- 2DRE LRI 83 TJyFTTLT (2)C SVRTYTTTE),,-

() ) DOBRE). "eNRTIY, BLRTIAN" D0 JWNAPNR "S0e3), TRTIAN" DO
BBNF,, 303 CBRIT,T,.

(ii) (B) DOBWED), "NTVWY AT TRTIOINE" DN0W RBWRNAPR "3DRTD A0edT
BRTOONNY" D02 BWNYI, B33P CRIITT,.

(iiy DBPTOI BVTB0RTRC), "NTWI T0eIT T3 SPRTY BRTIONNY) DI, 80T
A0e)T CRTIANNE) 02 BBNRPT "eDRT) AeITE 80T SRTY BRTIONNE) 03I, Y
0eJC BRETIONINE)" ed0W WBNPN, 31303 CRAIT,T,.

7. 10:3¢ &30 T W) BR.- 30RO IRIONNT 10:3¢ &B)FTTTE) -

() (N3 NVBTFTTRRS), "SI, AT TRTIONNY" D0W IJINLT "e9Te33),
A0e)T CRTIANNY" 02 BBNFI, TSR RCRBAIT,T),.

(i) Q)3 NVTTTTLT), "0 AT DEEIT™" D0 BWNPN "0 AOITT €T3
SRTY DEEIT®" D02 BWNFI, )33 CRAIT,T),.

8. 10> WFTHTW STWIBR.- e3P IRIONNT 1000 TyTTEITE), -

(i) (NS NBTTTRR), "SI, Ae)T CRTIANY" D0W BENPNR "9Te33),
79e)T BRTIONNY" D02 BBNY, 303 BRITT,.

(i) Q3¢ NBTJYFTTRRE). "TOWI), AT BLRTIONNY" D0W JWPNAPNR "e9T3I,
79e)T BRTIONNY" D02 BBNY, 3303 BRITT,.

9. 10D &TFOHTW 3WIRBB.- 30R LIRIONTNT 108 TJyFTLTE). (1) SVBTTTEITS
() DOBTA), "D SPTD 808330, DCEIT®" 02 BRNLT 2000 ARITT 0TBISRTY OEEIT
DO BERF, 3303 RSB,3,.

10. 109 R)FTOTW STWIRBR.- 3DRO LIRNIONTNT 109 JFTTLHR),, "S33), AedT
CRTIAINY"  D0W BEMPR "©9033), AT BRDIANE" D020 BENEFI,
33 RCBRIT,T,.

11. 1022 RFOEW W RJBR.- DR PRI 10288 JyFTE (2
VTV TTTLTE), "20T AReIT DCEIT*" 02 BBNPNR "dTRBY AT DEEIT®" D02 VBN,
33 RCBRIT,T,.

12. 1080 R)FOOTW STWI BR.- DR LIRIANNT 1080 TyTTEIT (1) NTV YT TEAT
(Q) DOBTA), "N SPTD 80a33), DT DOW J/INPT "200T) ARITT 80T SRTD
AT DO BWRPR, B3A3RCBRITLT,,.

13.1023 X)FOHTW 3O RJBRB.- DR IRIDINT 108 JyFTWD), DRI 3, 4T
A0e)T  CRTIOINY" N0 JWAPTR  "80e33), A0edT TRTIANY'" Q0W BBNPI),
33 RCBRIT,T,.

14. 10¥ RTOOT AW JVR.- NP IPIONDT 103 JFTHRE), a0 3, 4T
A0e)T  CRTIOINY" N0 BJWNPTR  "80e33), AeedT TRTIANE" Q0W BBNPI),
33 RCBRITT,,.



15. 100¢° RFFOPTW W RJBR.- DR  IPNIONDT 100 JyFTLIT  (2)3C
NBVTTTEIRE), "0 ARe)T EIT" 02 BBNPT "2,0T) AITT 80T ST DeEIT"
N0 BWNFI, &)3A3CRRIT,3,.

16. 1000 WFTOHTW W J/R.- DR  IPIONDET 1000 HTTLT ()3
NBTTTEIRE), "2WwOT) F0edT LT 0 BWNRLT "0 FoeITT 80T SRTY DCEIT"
DOW BERT, 3303CRRIB,E,.

17. 100°° RFOPT W BR.- DR BIRIONDT 10d° FFTLE (1)3€ eV
TYTTT () DOBRY), "QP) SRT 8333, DCEIT?" DOW BWNPNR "200T0 AOITT 80T
ST DEEIT 02 BTBNLT, SRR IITI,.

18. 113¢ RWVT0PTW STWHIJVR.- RO LIRIRNNT 113 JFTTW (1) v
TTTRTL),, " PR3 430 @0edT TRBDIONNF" D0W BWNPT "S©EI), A0edT RTINS
N0 BBNY, 3SR BRITT,,.

19. 11 TF0EW I JBR.- DRO RIARNDT 11 JTTLE (1)
BT TTREE). -

() " SOEI), AT BRTIONNF" DO0W WRNAYR "80e33), AedT BRTIONNE" D0W
BRAPI, B33 RCBRIT,T),;

(i) ROEI BWB0IZTE 33000 B3 E0DIWI, ADAIT,TD,, NOTWT:-

"9 B3¢ W3B0I, A0, 353,00 80T WRENPN0I B3, S AN, A A3
ROBPERE). 331 IWS0ITE T 3O3ROT) FREIENRPROTB WRE T, 38 ONPN 8053 AeIT
SRHIONNY BITL), Bed,D Jadyd, weITe)y AOWRAD WVRBIT,T), BT WOT) OF
BRTIONNFI, ATIT,B..."

20. 112 BB0T 3BI_RBB.- RO PICHENE 112 FFTLEE), -

() (N NOTTTTETD), “DTRBY OF CRTICANNE" D0 JWNPR  "D0BY OFI
80833, APeIT BRTWIONINF" 0 BWNFI), &)3A3RERRIT,T3,.

(i) (2 NTJTTTLR), "DBWY OF TRTICWNY" D0W JTPNYLR  "DBRY OFI
80e33), ARe)T CRTIONINE" 02 BWNPN, 303 RIT,T,.

21. 118 BHT RFOHT BEBER.- 5D HOIODHE 112 FBTHT 3CIET0DH S
ODTTE, FORSE,R,, DOTT:-

"B, IR, IPOF T, VBT LIRS, VRBIYOGF:T, IBRCE IFE PoodhTI),
RNToFD Y; RWCITO) I, JVAIPRFNY Y; IW3T0 IOV D3I,
P3NP ) BW, .- IR Y, ILOGsF, CVTRLIVRY, SVBALOGsT, IBRIE BT Do0DTTY,
RTED YD RFCITT DI, LDTRFRBTNY BN RFCITC ROWY s, P3sNEFS,
e300 301 e9PNAOND, 19613 4836 TTTLOTW  dWTBWAD (V) DOBT  9RODE)
VTVOPAVT W3 HOTF AWFS0TE SRV €3 13 £y 2023D0T D802 00N o3)3
8003 BRENDR B2, & sOBITE),.

22. 12:3¢ BT T 3T RBR.- 30RO LIPNIORNTNET 123¢ TyTTLTWE), -

(i) () DOBRE), "BR,,3,4730 TRTICINY)” D0 VWINPT "2 3, 4730 TRTWICINYD”
N0 BWNFI, &)3A3CRBRIT,3,.



(i) (2J) VOB (1) NTDOBRE), “DTTWY AT BRIV, “dTTI AOeITTI 80730
SPTY BRTIOINSY", "800 ARedT TRTIONNE)" 2D, "wOTD AT 803D ST
BRTIAINE)" 0L BWNRPN "dTT Aee)T 80530 ST CREIONNE)”, "e0RTB) AoedTTS 8053
SPT) CRTIANNEY”, "OF AT BRTIONNE)” &NI), "V AT BRTWIOINET" 0
BBNPT),, 93T 00N &S8OSR RIT,T,.

(i) (RAR) VOBBA), "T©RD), AT TRWIONNYY" D0 VWP "€9T33), AT
BREIOINS)" 02 BBNPI, 303 AT,

(iv) (R2RR) DOBRTA),, "DTRBY OF SRTIONF)" 02 VWINPT "OTRBY OFTET 80333,
A9e)T BRTIONTE” 02 BBNFRN, )303RCBR T,

(V) (%F°) OB, -

() (i) NNTROBRE), “T33), AT TRTWIONNE" 02 BWNYN "€9333), Ae)T
BTN 02 BBNPI, 303 AT,

() (V)R VTDOBRE). "®3I), A0edT TRBDWICAWTF)" D02 BWNPNR "Q®,3), 0edT
SR ONY" D020 BWNYI, &By303RCRAIT,T,.



VT LINPH H3), ToONnY BCPTF

2RI BT, NEDILAD B3, FoNFIR. 3TD0W FooFET LIPS eN0BOTRT
ROWY, D3yd, BXIINY aDIB), P3N PO, 195630, (19573 TIEET 9D 2)
3T BB 230RIE] 2NROT FORRLO FIONE DVE BTV aNI), FOATT ROWPNFI, D3I,
B3NP, TN T V3T WOIREBINTT, 323,53 €9e3T5Te30T3) SONEBRCIONGS.

ST DO B8 IGONT.



SDFT 2, IS R,

TA0e)3 TFOAVOIT FTNDOTW WORAE TN AeBd 67 T  BRemoINnY
22,230 e33JFET &3, QVOEPDMI .

23.2. mmm“m
IR, FOFDEOD BITOTRAHD )
TOFI TS TN [eY JeTOWO 0,

D038 ATV
FOONFTBEF(T)
BIOF 3T VPO Y



WO

FoOFET PN DORBOTW FOWF NP, Ne3y3, BCITNYH D3, P3N 9PADHD,
19560 (19570 T &% 9DODD F03; 2) v, 43 won

XX XX XX

3. PR3 DI, IWOFF0 F0oWF N &3, 33535 W3 N¥N.- (1) I 31 2,0
30PN 80e33), AReIT CRTWIANNY FOWF DI, WO WR/ET, 3DRT) OF S CINY
33335 B350, ROTWO 0B IT,T3),,.

(2) RYITsTON 20T ONPR 80e33Y, AT BRTIONNE FOWY aNIJY, WO H[B/E T,
SR OF BRTIONNY 33535 23350030, OO 0B IT,T30,.

4. FPWORB3ODTV), FYPOGF;FT INI0ZVWRT WORTW aDIND.- (1) AT 30DTTY,
RT3, YUBALIVW IO, CVTRLIVIsTT), cdTREERFTE 2DOTT), ATETT o005
REFCITO DI, JTRIFHBFTE 80V AFCITD, 3130A302,3) 3o, LIRTTT 93 &RIE
NI, BT ATE 3T0200NT TR, DBANY 9REPOD T WONKRT) SNT 95300
Wongesd) SNTGE @WONINPOT &R I), FSaCINEITE WP 20T RIAR,I DTNV,
23081 AOTROR BT WFRE) BB),Y,e300NT3T,T),. ST SIOF AR, adIN DTN
30oNnPR D0W3I), AT TRTIONTY WX, aDI RN 33T, B™,P0NBIT,T),. &3
ND-FFODE 3R WBNAIT  00AE aNION,  DCNNRCRBOT  FEdnee).
MABIRAPRITE), NI, BT HO0TF DALHOEFEY) AODNLNRIIWOT  INFI,
B33, 3.0,

XX XX XX

5. 830R 3 s 3), IWOG;BT 0B A~ (1) XX XX XX
(2) AR Y 3NI), ALRGsTON ATOETaY) 38 ONP) 2WOTY FeIT OEIT® BE3RLe> WINY
VB, T, ANV 0B B350, 331803/020,0Me FOTIIOD 0B IT,3),..

XX XX XX

6. PR3 DI, IYPFP B TDI), RFTOFOF) ZOWIOD BT
WOWIFNPI.- (1) AYPT3 DI, RYIGZsT3) 9IBTINY NNIWOA3eCNTO,N 430 &WyTTET (1)
UDTTTED oI, 53¢ TTTPT ORONE). 9[NP BOWTARE DRANPR DI,

RULE3T) TOTINYNR ROWORNATOI L9z3CINT) B8 2NI0ODN WLIENT I, ROTWOD 0TI
VT 0NT3T,3),, DOTWT:-

(D) RTEFTY) ROWIOD WIT  WOTD A0edT  OCEITING  BERL 3E,3,
B30T BEIRLN 323, aNI,

XX XX XX

8. TeRT DCATdwven TYPoR3, OR-IYPORS, RYPOGF, NR-TLPOG;T,
ABRCE WFEW ~oODNTD), ITOFD WDy RWCITFD) DI), JAVRCE ITE DIWV;
RWCITO) - YSBINY 0300 2335 eI, V3T 2335NP0.- (1) Xx XX XX

(2) PO03W WwPNR TooAR RWIN, AW, GUT-AYLRS, RYPIZsT oI, V-
AW, DCREE BVTE Do0NTT) ATED 3BNYs ReFCET aDIB), TG B[FE a30D;
RNFCITTI- Y3, -

() XX XX XX



() BROD NPT FTOJED eRTIIN 38 FRLICEDN DRI, RO TA,
Ry BWTT, B, L,300NT 3T,

XX XX XX

(&) RO DINPMN NI, O3 I FTS), NPTTRRE IIDIT, TR
79e)T BRTIONNY DIE3NPR BT),¥,es00NC3T,30,:

BVC0D), Dot BRTN 300V TWjedRANY RFOWRENF ) TOIRNHT DINDT 03I,
BRI BFTS), VPTTRD S Tyd DIT, TR ARITE 805030 SRTICINY DI,
80T3) AOeIT BRTIANTE) DI23350350N333,33),:

XX XX XX

10. I-I PR3 DI), WR-T LGB0 JOWFNYH.- (1) SUB-AL0BY aNI), SVR-
RYOZsT B 8B RWONP 30NPR S©e33), AedT BRTIAINE ROWPTI, RO
RRBIT,T),.

(2) PUT-ALT3 NI), YTW-ALRFT B &3A3RV,0NW, Td S0NPR, 20T AT
ACET® B3 er® W3R FeDTOTW WD 233 5e33), FOTWIOD 0B ITLR3),,.

10. VRB-TYPORS, NRB-JIYPWOGF;BT PO IPoRS IFI  IWPGFFT°RO
FIFRNYR, DWFoRIT W3t FOTIOD R ICFTOT JOWY, VOB NI, WOBS
233;.- (1) BB RIDRNTE). DI YW TR, ALIVTIOD Ao, W) YW, e0I), AWD AT
TIE NP, NVT-AYWOTS €ITe00 A0S 1843 €93023.LT3T3 (1) DOTWTS BN ST
RRRT AP BORIY,S ABABRW,T) De3cART, NT-ALRY 9IGFw 0T ATBAON
933 TN TIF Dy DS 0AT WBPMN T8 3ONPR S©WRI), AT TRT[IONY
ROWFR, ROWROD BITEY, NI, ART, 33030 FToT) WwBNRIT,E, DI, 5 DI,
63 WTTLINY NVTWWOGFNY LIRNAOT 200/ 2335330y A0 RVBIT,T3,.:

(2) B8 RIRDNDT), DI YT TR, ALOFsTS Ao,y VO [V a0I), €3 50
AT TIEWNP), NB-AWOGFT 9B A0IPRIE 1803 e9NWLRT (1) DOBT
SBR BEDTRROTOT PSR LI ABABR W, De3e0ART OGS TIF NP, 9233
AT OT 9BDMIN 953071 &) 30NN SR IY, AOIT BRHDVICNY F0WY FOTOD
TBITE), NI, RRT, JeLERT) TG, WBNRIT,ED, BN 5 DI, 6:3¢ TTTTW
NTWOPNY LITVIART 2I0TB 33583730, ROTWION 2T IT,TI),.:

XX XX XX

10, OBV-TLPORS DI, NVRB-FLOF;FO ToNe ITOFT JOWIOD BTG
2323,1N.- (1) PUR-FLR S DI, PUT-ALIGsTI 43¢ FTTEIT (1) V@ TTeD 3303), 103
TYTTRT oD €938 WFTMON BOWT 0BT D0AR s a0, 23033 ToTINY
ROWOFTE), BB TN 2323, NP, RO 23T0TBEN WL TONTI TR, OTT:-

() ATIETag) ROWIO 2300RT NP SRV 80a33), DEEIT?* BE3ee® 3e3N03 BTN
3, Sod, 30T FOTINDT 9N B5e9003 B3 23¢5; 53y,

1079. dBRCE VFE TODFTN FOWY.- ITRIG BFE 3B, MORTIN JonDnR
S0e33), AT CRTIONY B0 FeI), FOTWIOR B3 T,E,.

XX XX XX



1023. VPG IFW TooDFTONR HoBI FPOYWs.- (1) Doy ATOETay) &S8OSR,
edBREE BFEW VRODTIN PR BT, 3030080 ToTI), WwBNAIT,E),,.

(2) B803R2, DTG BT POONTAIN AT Tag) 38 JONS) 2,003 AReIT DEEIT® B3R
BT BeHTOT 0B 53Z;00:0, FOTICH FVBIF,E.,.

XX XX XX

1080. JBRCE [FEW Po0DTV) DI), IFOFT JOTWIOD R WETT 3%3,NYH.- (1)
30302, LTURLE BVFTL VONT 4 TFTTEIT (1) QVTETTED 3303, 1023 T3S a0¢TNR
9330 WPFTMON BOWBTF ORBEIRT OAR DN aI), wWRCEDT) TS ROWORRE). &8
FORS FHONPI), OO TN T TINTIT,E),, DOTWT:-

() ATOETed) ROV VRT DPISPTD 80533, DEIT* &We3eLer 3e3N03 BeFo,N
3D, 3330V TOTINY R WF AT BEIRIL® a323,; a03I),

1023. IBoFD Doy IWCIFON JowY.- B3RP, ITFD RFCITOR JonPn
DR 3,473 AT CEdOINY FOWPI), AOTWIOR 0B I3TE),..

10¥. dBRCE RFXR Dy IWE3FC JOWY.- T3P, JBREE BT 0D
ReFC3TON 30ONDNR a3, 4T3 AT CRTIONNY FOVFS), RO &0BIT,EI),.

100e5%. IFTIFD eIV FWFCIFTON DB F°OW5.- (1) XX XX XX

(2) TyB3BPW, ITIED BN FFCITIN AT Ty 78 3ONY) WO AT DCEIT®
BE3)L* 3SR BT 2B 2335330, AOTWOI 0B IT,T3),,.

1000. VR VT eIV FWFCIFOMN ToON 35e37,.- (1) xx XX Xx

2) By3ABPRW, ITREE BVFET B0Vs AFEITONR 30NN 20T AT AT N FWé3pLer
G308, ReHers 0N 33,00, DLEIE,R,.

XX XX XX

1000°. IFTFD WD IWC3T eDI), AVRFPRITE D JWCIFON ITFTY)
Fowood B LICTOR 323, NPN.- (1) T)30302), ATIED BNV AFIT eI, LDTRCFTITE
BN RFCITONR 43¢ BTTRT (1) VBT TTED a0I), ROTWLPREINAIT 100> &TT€D
953230 10000 TTEITT e33R, €9z30N BOWT 0BT 2OAT 20N a0IJY, 3CE3T) ToDI
FOWOFTBS), 88 TYN 3PAT 38,NF ), RO 300RBEN 0T 0CNTBIT,T),, DOTWT:-

() ATOE Tag) RO TRRT DY) ST 80a33), DCET® B3R We3N0I3 BLF,N
3D, 233DV TOTINY R WFAT BEIRL® a323,; a3,

11. APIF LI D), APON IVRI,S IWR;0 FOWY.- (1) LDPOSAL €900 PO
BORIS &8303PW, RWAIN 3ONPR YT, 3,403 Aee)T CRTIONNY FOWFS3), RO
BOBITE),. &8 ROWP) R0, TFPWB N 2HVONAUNT  DOTD LA
BVOTDOT 930N DB 20N 3T,R), W0 IPOSAL IR0 PO BORIIC). 30D
A3, 3V0WE) Tssm00OD0T NN TN 0BT AWRAT FOTWLEERE), 933830,
TNt VOTNAITE TS 0BT DVVOTROTW T WD Aoy V0N BRWEX 90T
PARB 9B D0NITETT PBRTBT €3 DDA, MWOERT DIP0TDOT O
ROV P D NI T,

XX XX XX



10

11R. IBI0NR VT3, BC3BS IO~ (1) FOFET LIPS 2DOBOTWRT LITNYD,
a3y 3, BITND DI, P3NY (3TN W) IR0, 20093 5 B0LE DV0TOT 0N
232303,

(i) PO BORIS W, AWR0N; 9T
(ii) LRI ALIOD 20, ATWAON; €T30
(i) 2N APIALIOD BBATIN DI, LN LIPOSBORIS AW TN

- 80330 VRENPBTN Ak BD AT B)303RW, 853,77, 938 NPT 2€e)TRTHONS)., )8
30onPR I I), FOIT BRTWIONINY BT, N3y, 333N, RO B IT,T),.:

XX XX XX

9T BT03), 0T 358, 80T WRENPNOZ BRI A A AN, S0I3TTW
TPPENRPOT Tyd TJVRET, BeN,2OAN T8 JONPNR 2,01 AT BRIANY BITE).
B, a3y, BITBR,, WS 3RIT,),.

XX XX XX

11%. 3335 BP3;.- (1) TR BFE VOONTIN WRE Ty, DT OF TRDIOINY 33535
2335 AOTPONWINIT,T),.

(2) OUT-RPPWS, VT-AYWIFsT, ATOED VYD ReFCIT 20I), LATREE BT a5
RFCIT- YSON WRE T, DT OF BRIVIAINY 33535 335 AOTDONWNI T,

XX XX XX

12. APOVIY IBF;0) DI, PN RDRFT IWR 0D - Q0N IO 2335
NI, DIP3NF DB, 3yTWsBOD aNI), VIV APOLND.- &8 e9IPACNNT  &0¢3BN
BBRVE AORNINE ePRDOT ABEDRODTIOT BBINRDT 2F3E30,,-

(D) APJAE D), PSS BORIS AWAONR  TeoANPR  FOWORAT03I
QAODNRITOT RO NPR wFBED, 9T 3e30CNET) STE 03 3T, TodT3
FTOe 233,00 WD T3O3ROT) AN WwOTD ARITE 80T ST BRWIONNY AN
TO3oed B350, O30T WNRAD &W)OVEIINTS) ITT, )8 Fe3@ECIIEIDN BT, 3, ;T30
SRTIONNY BITE), F)od0ce 233550 AOWIONWINITRY,. NI, D). AWAONP €930
T 00 €953F5edTe A INFS), LT YO TRLDE N AW, INPOT SR e35a32,03030,
AV WBNIIT,E,,. s3I, WOT B[RS e35333,0030, :BRTE FOWLEERE), ATA IR BLIOD
OB T8 DIF, DI, AL DYT0LP@OME DATBODT ATBY DINY NI, A3
ETLONRROT SOITTW DTRBY DING 93N Q3,403 CRE@OINY 23358330, ROTROD
RRBIT,T),.

(@) &), RS OM -

() €538 RPN BOHTBITT,N DI, RO STWIES 20303 N8BT DO ONAT
NPs03C CRDINPLMON Tl WwPNB, T8 DIT, VR A0edT CRTIONNY) 203,
90033 C). 930 BRT ToXNPD), T8 DIT, AVW) A0ITTW 3 SRTY SRTIOINY
DITP35 RO ONIONIT,T),,.

(i) R, ABAON ALY WDT0230MES DTTY DINE RBRTEN 2D, A2 eT,0NWT
S03TT DTV DINDR DJLB 356 AOTWRONIINIT,LI,.



11

Q) TJ3RBRW, ATA; OB PR AWARs oNI), 9IVIPODNR AR 9T
95300203 00T €93 EN0WT AWRTI, -

(RR) ST FPOD DD, AP JORIST T[3A3RW, ATRD, WDV FLI
FOee  P3s00N Fd 30NN S©EI),  AedT BRTOOINE RSRVON),
Q0D NRWTBITVE DESONE), R LTI BB, e300 NBIT,T0,..

(RAR) R2B33, Tozsg A2ded, MUT-A3eS, AYTY, AT, PVEW-RLI0TY, YVFT-ALIOsT,
edBREE BFEW DOODT ,ATED a0V AeFCIT DI, TG TFE 0D AWCST Ya3Ce
ADTO3 T33P, ATARD, B8 BEITOA) WRE T, DONNRWIBIIEOT DEIONE)
D), 90T BB NPT 2WwFTE, WO 9T B3, TYOIRNF T, 2020,¢ 31D 980
BR3IMITIRODT e3ne) I33TE), deSTBIANRSD) 90 Fye3 00 NROFT  030e)T3E
BEE0DE). TR0 VTBEN TYeIRAT VT LST,N DAY eI, L9TFR,LWT° JONYID). T
©F CRBDONNTR, DTE Fedos TOIMTE) BBEITHLL) B, eINCITE,. OT
FOIONT,  IORWIN  ABRTY  myodee @ OIP3;  BHBODheN
B, 0oNT 3T,

XX XX XX
(325%) B30, ABRINB S8 50D 3357eH BOIOD 30N 3B, -

(i) BRTWORD 203, B3R FONLMN 9330 BOAE 3@B,NPMN 3oNPR 93,30,
0eJC BTN,

(i) 2DV FLI) P3NP N SO, AedT CHA;
(iii) €90 BW,NY RO 80530 AT Bz,

(iv) ATRsD, ATRsoN 3T, TIERBNPR, DSECRL) €3, ATIORNTAIN D3I,
BP0V NP FOWF 0T B3, A0edT CRzTQN.

XX XX XX

TRFO INTEOOND, QARG TUE, KRR, &7, AR . IR 500, 218 FWRO 2021



3

KARNATAKA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
FIFTEENTH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
TWELFTH SESSION

THE KARNATAKA LEGISLATURE SALARIES, PENSIONS
AND ALLOWANCES (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2022

(LA Bill No. 06 of 2022)

A Bill further to amend the Karnataka Legislature Salaries, Pensions and
Allowances Act, 1956.

Whereas it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Legislature Salaries,
Pensions and Allowances Act, 1956 (Karnataka Act 2 of 1957) for the purposes
hereinafter appearing;

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the Seventy third year of
the Republic of India, as follows:-

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the
Karnataka Legislature Salaries, Pensions and Allowances (Amendment) Act, 2022.

(2) It shall come into force with effect from 1stday of April, 2022.

2. Amendment of section 3.- In the Karnataka Legislature Salaries,
Pensions and Allowances Act, 1956 (Karnataka Act 2 of 1957), (hereinafter referred
to as the Principal Act), in section 3,-

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words "fifty thousand rupees", the words
"seventy five thousand rupees" and for the words "three lakhs rupees",
the words "four lakhs rupees" shall be substituted;

"

(ii) in sub section (2), for the words "fifty thousand rupees", the words
seventy five thousand rupees" and for the words "three lakhs rupees",
the words "four lakhs rupees" shall be substituted.

3. Amendment of section 4. - In section 4 of the Principal Act, in sub-
section (1), for the words "eighty thousand rupees", the words "one lakh sixty
thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

4. Amendment of section 5.- In section 5 of the Principal Act, in sub-
section (2), for the words "one thousand', the words "two thousand" shall be
substituted.

5. Amendment of section 6.- In section 6 of the Principal Act, in sub-
section (1), in clause (a), for the words "one thousand", the words "two thousand "
shall be substituted.

6. Amendment of section 8.- In section 8 of the Principal Act, in sub
section (2),-

(i) in clause (b), for the words "thirty rupees", the words "forty rupees" shall
be substituted.

(i) in clause (d), for the words "rupees two thousand", the words "rupees
three thousand" shall be substituted.



2

(iii) in first proviso, for the words "two thousand five hundred rupees and
five thousand rupees” the words “three thousand five hundred rupees
and seven thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

7. Amendment of section 10.- In section 10 of the Principal Act,-

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words "forty thousand rupees", the words "sixty
thousand rupees" shall be substituted,;

(iij in sub-section (2), for the words "one thousand litres”, the words "one
thousand five hundred litres" shall be substituted.

8. Amendment of section 10A.- In section 10A of the Principal Act,-

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words "forty thousand rupees", the words "sixty
thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

(ii) in sub-section (2), for the words "forty thousand rupees", the words "sixty
thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

9. Amendment of section 10D.- In section 10D of the Principal Act, in sub-
section (1) in clause (a) for the words "seven hundred and fifty litres” , the words
"one thousand five hundred litres" shall be substituted.

10. Amendment of section 10E.- In section 10E of the Principal Act, for the
words "forty thousand rupees", the words "sixty thousand rupees" shall be
substituted.

11. Amendment of section 10G.- In section 10G of the Principal Act, in sub-
section (2), for the words "one thousand litres ", the words "two thousand litres"
shall be substituted.

12. Amendment of section 10I.- In section 10I of the Principal Act, in sub-
section (1),in clause (a) for the words "seven hundred and fifty litres”, the words
"one thousand five hundred litres" shall be substituted.

13. Amendment of section 10J.- In section 10J of the Principal Act, for the
words "thirty five thousand rupees", the words "fifty thousand rupees" shall be
substituted.

14. Amendment of section 10K.- In section 10K of the Principal Act, for the
words " thirty five thousand rupees"”, the words "fifty thousand rupees" shall be
substituted.

15. Amendment of section 10L.- In section 10L of the Principal Act, in sub-
section (2), for the words "one thousand litres", the words "one thousand five
hundred litres" shall be substituted.

16. Amendment of section 10M.- In section 10M of the Principal Act, in
sub-section (2), for the words "one thousand litres", the words " one thousand five
hundred litres" shall be substituted.

17. Amendment of section 10N.- In section 10N of the Principal Act, in sub-
section (1), in clause (a) for the words "seven hundred and fifty litres”, the words
"one thousand five hundred litres" shall be substituted.

18. Amendment of section 11.- In section 11 of the Principal Act, in sub-
section (1), for the words "twenty five thousand rupees", the words "forty thousand
rupees"” shall be substituted.



3

19. Amendment of section 11A.- In section 11A of the Principal Act, in sub-
section (1),-

(i) for the words “forty thousand rupees” the words “fifty thousand rupees”
shall be substituted.

(i) for the eighth proviso, the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“Provided also that, where any person has served for more than five years
there shall be paid to him an additional pension at the rate of rupees five
thousand per mensem for every subsequent completed term which shall
not exceed rupees one lakh.”

20. Amendment of section 11C.- In section 11C of the Principal Act,-

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words "two lakh rupees", the words
"two lakhs fifty thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

(ii) in sub-section (2), for the words "two lakh rupees", the words
"two lakhs fifty thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

21. Insertion of new section 11D.- After section 11C of the Principal Act,
the following shall be inserted, namely:-

“11D. Increase in Salary and Allowances of the Chairman, the Speaker,
the Deputy Chairman, the Deputy Speaker, the Leaders of Opposition, the
Government Chief whips and the Opposition Chief Whips.- The salary and
allowances of the Chairman, the Speaker, the Deputy Chairman, the Deputy
Speaker, the Leaders of Opposition, the Government Chief whips and the
Opposition Chief Whips shall be increased after every five years commencing from
1st April, 2023 on the basis of Cost Inflation Index provided under clause (v) of
Explanation to section 48 of the Income-tax Act, 1961.”

22. Amendment of section 12.- In section 12 of the Principal Act,-

(i) in clause (a) for the words “twenty five rupees” the words “thirty five
rupees” shall be substituted.

(ii) in clause (b) in sub-clause (i) for the words “two thousand rupees”, “two
thousand five hundred rupees”, “five thousand rupees” and “one thousand five
hundred rupees” the words “two thousand five hundred rupees”, “three thousand
five hundred rupees”, “seven thousand rupees” and “two thousand rupees” shall
respectively be substituted.

(iii) in clause (cc) for the words “forty thousand rupees” the words “sixty
thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

(iv) in clause (ccc) for the words “two lakh rupees” the words “two lakhs fifty
thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

(v) in clause (h),-

(@) in sub-clause (ii) for the words “forty thousand rupees” the words “sixty
thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

(b) in sub-clause (iv) for the words “ten thousand rupees” the words “twenty
thousand rupees” shall be substituted.



4
STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

There is a considerable increase in the cost of living. Therefore, it is
considered necessary to enhance the salaries and allowances of the parliamentary
functionaries and the legislators and certain other benefits by amending the
Karnataka Legislature Salaries, Pensions and Allowances Act, 1956 (Karnataka
Act 2 of 1957).

Hence, the Bill.



5
FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

There will be a recurring approximate additional expenditure of Rs. 67
crores per annum from the proposed legislative measure.

J.C. MADHU SWAMY
Minister for Law, Parliamentary
Affairs and Legislation and
Minor Irrigation

M.K. VISHALAKSHI
Secretary (I/c)
Karnataka Legislative Assembly



6
ANNEXURE

Extract from the Karnataka Legislature Salaries, Pensions and Allowances Act, 1956
(Karnataka Act 2 of 1957)

XX XX XX

3. Salaries and sumptuary allowances of Chairman and Speaker.- (1) There shall
be paid to the Chairman a salary of fifty thousand rupees per mensem and a sumptuary

allowance of three lakhs rupees per annum.

(2) There shall be paid to the Speaker a salary of fifty thousand rupees per mensem

and a sumptuary allowance of three lakhs rupee per annum.
XX XX XX

4. Residences of Chairman, Speaker etc. .- (1) The Chairman,. Speaker, Deputy
Chairman, Deputy Speaker, Leader of Opposition, Government Chief Whip and Opposition
Chief Whip each shall be entitled to the use of a furnished residence in the City of
Bangalore within thirty kilometres from the limits of the City of Bangalore throughout his
term of office and for a period of sixty days immediately thereafter, or, in lieu of such
furnished residence, to a house rent allowance at the rate of eighty thousand rupees per
mensem. The residence provided under this sub-section shall be furnished on such scales

and the plinth area thereof shall not exceed such limits, as may be prescribed.

(2) In a residence used by the Chairman or the Speaker, who is entitled to a house
rent allowance in lieu of furnished residence, three rooms shall be furnished by the State
Government on such scales as may be prescribed, to be used for official purposes. He shall
be entitled for an allowance of ten thousand rupees per month for maintenance and upkeep

of the residence and for layout and maintenance of gardens included in such residence.
XX XX XX

5. Conveyances of the Chairman and the Speaker.- (1) The State Government may

provide a suitable motor car each for the use of the Chairman and the Speaker.

(2) There shall be paid to the Chairman and the Speaker each a conveyance

allowance equal to the cost of one thousand litres of petrol per mensem.
XX XX XX

6. Charges payable by the Chairman and the Speaker and the Government.- (1)
The Chairman and the Speaker shall, in respect of their respective residences and the
motor cars allotted for their use under sub-section (1) of section 4 and section 5, be liable

to pay the following charges, namely:—



7

(a) cost of petrol required for their respective motor cars in excess of the cost of one

thousand litres litres of petrol paid by the Government; and
XX XX XX

8. Travelling and other allowances of the Chairman, the Deputy Chairman, the
Speaker and the 1[Deputy Speaker, the Leaders of the Opposition ,the Government
Chief Whips and the Opposition Chief Whips on tours.- (1)

XX XX XX

(2) While touring inside India]lthe Chairman, the Deputy Chairman, the Speaker
and the Deputy Speaker, the Leaders of the Opposition,the Government Chief Whips and
the Opposition Chief Whips shall be entitled,—

XX XX XX
(b) for journeys by road, to road mileage at thirty rupees per kilometre;
XX XX XX

(d) to daily allowance at rupees two thousand per day for the days of journey and for

the days of halt at any place:

Provided that in the case of tours outside the State, the daily allowance shall be at
two thousand five hundred rupees and five thousand rupees per day for the days of

journey and for the days of halt at any place:
XX XX XX

10. Salaries of Deputy Chairman and Deputy Speaker.- (1) There shall be paid to
the Deputy Chairman and to the Deputy Speaker each a salary of forty thousand rupees

pPer mensem.

(2) There shall be paid to the Deputy Chairman and the Deputy Speaker a

conveyance allowance of equal to the cost of one thousand litres of petrol per mensem.
XX XX XX

10A. Salary, conveyance and conveyance allowance payable to the Deputy
Chairman, Deputy Speaker or the person performing the duties of the Chairman or
Speaker.- (1) Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act, while the office of the
Chairman is vacant and the duties of the said office are performed by the Deputy Chairman
or a member of the Legislative Council appointed under clause (1) of Article 184 of the
Constitution, the Deputy Chairman or such member, shall, during the period he so

performs such duties, be paid a salary of forty thousand rupees per mensem and provided



8
with a suitable motor car and paid conveyance allowance in accordance with the provisions
of sections 5 and 6:

XX XX XX

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act, while the office of the Speaker is
vacant and the duties of the office are performed by the Deputy Speaker or member of the
Legislative Assembly appointed under clause (1) of Article 180 of the Constitution, the
Deputy Speaker or such member shall, during the period he so performs such duties, be
paid salary of forty thousand rupees per mensem and provided with a suitable motor car

and paid conveyance allowance in accordance with the provisions of sections 5 and 6:
XX XX XX

10D. Charges payable by the Deputy Chairman and the Deputy Speaker and the
Government.- (1) The Deputy Chairman and the Deputy Speaker shall, in respect of their
respective residences and the motor cars allotted for their use under sub-section (1) of

section 4 and section 10C, be liable to pay the following charges, namely:—

(a) cost of petrol required for their respective motor car in excess of the cost of seven

hundred and fifty litres of petrol paid by the Government; and
XX XX XX

10E. Salary to the Leader of the Opposition.- There shall be paid to each Leader

of the Opposition a salary of forty thousand rupees per mensem.
XX XX XX
10G. Conveyance for the Leader of the Opposition.- (1)
XX XX XX

(2) There shall be paid to each Leader of the Opposition a conveyance allowance

equal to the cost of one thousand litres of petrol per mensem.

10I. Charges payable by the Leader of the Opposition and the Government.- (1)
Each Leader of the Opposition shall in respect of the residence and the motor car allotted
for his use under sub-section (1) of section 4 and section 10G, be liable to pay the following

charges, namely:—

(a) cost of petrol required for their respective motor car in excess of the cost of seven

hundred and fifty litres of petrol paid by the Government; and
XX XX XX

10J. Salary to the Government Chief Whip.- There shall be paid to each

Government Chief Whip a salary of thirty five thousand rupees per mensem.



9

p.o. ¢ XX XX

10K. Salary to the Opposition Chief Whip.- There shall be paid to each Opposition

Chief Whip a salary of thirty five thousand rupees per mensem.
XX XX XX
10L. Conveyance for the Government Chief Whip.- (1)
XX XX XX

(2) There shall be paid to each Government Chief Whip a conveyance allowance

equal to the cost of one thousand litres of petrol per mensem
10M. Conveyance for the Opposition Chief Whip.- (1)
XX XX XX

(2) There shall be paid to each Opposition Chief Whip a conveyance allowance equal

to the cost of one thousand litres of petrol per mensem.
XX XX XX

10N. Charges payable by the Government Chief Whip 2 [,and the Opposition
Chief Whip.- (1) Each Government Chief Whip and each Opposition Chief Whip shall in
respect of the residence and the motor car allotted for his use under sub-section (1) of
section 4 and section 10L or section 10M, as the case may be, liable to pay|2 the following

charges, namely:—

(a) cost of petrol required for their respective motor cars in excess of the cost of seven

hundred and fifty litres of petrol paid by the Government; and
XX XX XX

11. Salary of members of the Legislative Assembly and the Legislative Council.-
(1) There shall be paid to every member of the Legislative Assembly or of the Legislative
Council a salary of twenty five thousand rupees per mensem which shall accrue to him
from the day on which he is declared duly elected, or, in the case of a member nominated
by the Governor to fill a seat in the Legislative Assembly or the Legislative Council, from the
date on which he is so nominated, or, if such declaration or nomination is made before the

vacancy occurs, from the date of occurrence of the vacancy:
XX XX XX

11A. Pension to the members etc.- (1) With effect from the date of commencement
of the Karnataka Legislature Salaries, Pensions and Allowances (Amendment) Act, 2009

there shall be paid to every person who has served for a period of five years as,-

(i) a member of the Legislative Council; or



10
(ii) a member of the Legislative Assembly; or
(iii) partly as a member of the Legislative Assembly and partly as a member of

the Legislative Council, a pension at the rate of forty thousand rupees per

mensem for the remainder of his life:
XX XX XX

Provided also that where any person has served for more than five years there shall
be paid to him an additional pension at the rate of rupees one thousand per mensem for

every subsequent completed year.

Explanation.- For the purpose of this sub-section, a member of the Legislative

Assembly or the Legislative Council includes,-

(1) a person who prior to the 1st day of November 1956 represented any of the areas
which with effect on and from the said date have become part of the new State of
Karnataka, as a member of the Legislative Assembly or the Legislative Council of the State

of which the said areas were part:

Provided that in the case of a nominated member of the Legislative Assembly or the
Legislative Council he shall be eligible for the pension if during his membership of the
Legislative Assembly or the Legislative Council, he permanently resided in any area which

forms part of the State of Karnataka.

(2) a person who was a member of the following (before the first day of January,

1952) namely:-
(a) The Constituent Assembly;
(b) The Mysore Representative Assembly;
(c) The Mysore Legislative Assembly;

(d) The Legislative Assembly or the Legislative Council of any State (including an

Indian State) or Province,

Which or any area of which now forms part of the State of Karnataka. Provided that

no such pension shall be paid to a person unless,-

(i) in the case of a person who served as a member representing a territorial

Constituency, he represented; and

(ii) in the case of any other member, he permanently resided during such

membership in, any area which now forms part of the State of Karnataka.

XX XX XX



11

11C. Sumptuary allowance.- (1) The Leaders of the Opposition shall be paid a

sumptuary allowance of two lakh rupees per annum.

(2) The Deputy Chairman, the Deputy Speaker,the Government Chief Whips and the
Opposition Chief Whips shall be paid a sumptuary allowance of two lakh rupees per

annum.
XX XX XX

12. Travelling and daily allowances of, and medical and other facilities to,
members of the Legislative Assembly and the Legislative Council.- Subject to such

conditions as may be determined by rules made under this Act,—

(a) there shall be paid to the members of the Legislative Assembly and of the
Legislative Council traveling allowance for journeys at the rate of twenty five rupees per kilo
metre irrespective of mode of journey subject to such conditions as may be prescribed or
fixed traveling allowance rupees one thousand five hundred for each meeting in lieu of

traveling allowance calculated on the basis of distance traveled in kilometers.
(b) there shall be paid,—

(i) to all members daily allowance for attending the meetings and for the prescribed
number of days of holidays, intervals or absence between meetings at the rate of two
thousand rupees per-diem within the State and two thousand five hundred rupees and five
thousand rupees per diem for stay in hotel or other registered establishment providing
boarding and lodging at scheduled tariffs subject to production of bills and also one

thousand five hundred rupees towards local transport per-diem outside the State in India;
xx xx XX

(cc) Every member of the Legislative Assembly and of the Legislative Council shall be
entitled to receive in the prescribed manner, a sum of rupees forty thousand per month as

constituency Traveling Allowance

(ccc) Every member including a Minister, a Minister of State, a Deputy Minister, a
Chairman, a Speaker, a Deputy Chairman, a Deputy Speaker, a Leader of the Opposition
and a Government Chief Whip and a Opposition Chief Whip shall, for every financial year,
be entitled to receive in such manner and subject to such conditions, as may be prescribed,
a sum of rupees two lakh rupees in two equal instalments payable in the months of April
and October for the purpose of travelling either single or with a companion in one or more
journeys by air or by any class or by any railway in India. A member shall not be entitled to

any travelling or daily allowance for such journeys.

XX XX XX



12

(h) every member shall be paid an allowance of,—

(i) twenty thousand rupees per month towards meeting the expenditure incurred

by him on telephone and cell phone calls;
(ii) forty thousand rupees per month as constituency allowances;
(iii) five thousand rupees per month on postal charges;

(iv) ten thousand rupees as the salary of the Personal Assistant and the Room Boy

of the Member; in the discharge of his duties as a member

Explanation.—For the purpose of this section, ‘meeting’ means a meeting of the
Legislative Assembly or the Legislative Council or of any committee of the said Assembly or

Council or of both.

Govt. Press, Vikasa Soudha, Bengaluru, 21at February, 2022, P7, W.D. , Copies 500



